

Subject: FW: Public Records Request (WI-REP-22-1119)
Date: Friday, February 17, 2023 at 4:47:41 PM Eastern Standard Time
From: Downloads
To: AO Records
Attachments: ASM63 - 2022.10.24 - Am Oversight - invoice.zip

From: Redell, Carol <Carol.Redell@legis.wisconsin.gov>
Sent: Friday, February 17, 2023 1:46:44 PM (UTC-08:00) Pacific Time (US & Canada)
To: Downloads <Downloads@americanoversight.org>
Cc: Rep.Vos <Rep.Vos@legis.wisconsin.gov>; Fawcett, Steve <Steve.Fawcett@legis.wisconsin.gov>; Blazel, Ted <Ted.Blazel@legis.wisconsin.gov>
Subject: RE: Public Records Request (WI-REP-22-1119)

EXTERNAL SENDER

Dylan Winters
American Oversight
dylan.winters@americanoversight.org

Dear Mr. Winters:

Open records requests are processed through the Assembly Chief Clerk's office for billing purposes only. You submitted an open records request Representative Vos. The records are being provided in electronic format and, thus, there is no charge for any location or reproduction costs. Accordingly, all records that are responsive to your request are attached to this email.

Carol Redell
Office of the Assembly Chief Clerk
17 West Main Street, Suite 401
Madison, Wisconsin 53703
608.266.1501
carol.redell@legis.wi.gov

From: Fawcett, Steve <Steve.Fawcett@legis.wisconsin.gov>
Sent: Friday, February 17, 2023 3:19 PM
To: records@americanoversight.org
Cc: Blazel, Ted <Ted.Blazel@legis.wisconsin.gov>
Subject: FW: Public Records Request (WI-REP-22-1119)

Dear Mr. Winters,

This is in response to your public records request dated 10/24. Your request is attached.

Responsive records have been delivered to the Office of the Assembly Chief Clerk. The Assembly Chief Clerk will be in contact with you with instructions on how to retrieve those records. We now consider this matter closed. Thank you.

Sincerely,

Steve Fawcett

General Counsel
Office of Assembly Speaker Robin Vos
608.266.3387

From: Rep.Vos <Rep.Vos@legis.wisconsin.gov>
Sent: Monday, October 24, 2022 11:00 AM
To: Fawcett, Steve <Steve.Fawcett@legis.wisconsin.gov>
Subject: FW: Public Records Request (WI-REP-22-1119)

From: AO Records <records@americanoversight.org>
Sent: Friday, October 21, 2022 9:50 AM
To: Blazel, Ted <Ted.Blazel@legis.wisconsin.gov>; Rep.Vos <Rep.Vos@legis.wisconsin.gov>
Subject: Public Records Request (WI-REP-22-1119)

Dear Public Records Custodian:

Please find attached a request for records under Wisconsin's public records law.

Sincerely,
Dylan Winters (he/him)
Paralegal
American Oversight
records@americanoversight.org
www.americanoversight.org | @weareoversight

PRR: WI-REP-22-1119



Mr. Steve Fawcett
 General Counsel
 Office of State Assembly Speaker Robin Vos

09/12/22
 Federal Tax ID 04-3597929

INVOICE #: 343796

Re: American Oversight v. Wisconsin State Assembly,
 Speaker Robin Vos and Edward A. Blazel
 Our File: 98350
 Claim Number: N/A

Date of Service	Description of Service	Professional	Hours
Aug 1, 2022	Review petitioner's letter to the court regarding submission of bill of costs of judgment. [L250, A104]	JES	0.20
Aug 4, 2022	Outlined status and issues for appeal. [L120, A104]	RSS	0.80
Aug 15, 2022	Review notice of entry of final order. [L250, A104]	JES	0.20
Aug 15, 2022	Began to draft motion for reconsideration of the order on summary judgment. [L120, A103]	RSS	3.20
Aug 16, 2022	Revise and draft motion for reconsideration. [L460, A103]	RSS	3.20
Aug 17, 2022	Revise motion for reconsideration. [L240, A103]	RSS	0.40

<u>Date of Service</u>	<u>Description of Service</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Aug 17, 2022	Review, revise and finalize response to AO request. [L460, A103]	RSS	0.30
Aug 18, 2022	Draft notice of appeal [L510, A103]	HBB	0.30
Aug 19, 2022	Edit notice of appeal [L510, A103]	HBB	0.10
Aug 19, 2022	Draft docketing statement. [L510, A103]	HBB	1.20
Aug 19, 2022	Make edits to docketing statement [L510, A103]	HBB	0.20
TOTAL HOURS			10.10

**KOPKA PINKUS DOLIN PC
INVOICE SUMMARY**

Please remit to: 100 Lexington Drive, Suite 100, Buffalo Grove, IL 60089-6937
(847) 549-9611
98350

Professional	Level	Hourly Rate	Hours	Total
Jonathan E Sacks	Associate	235.00	0.40	94.00
Herschel B Brodkey	Associate	235.00	1.80	423.00
Ronald S Stadler	Partner	275.00	7.90	2,172.50
Total Time:			10.10	2,689.50

Total this Invoice: \$2,689.50



Mr. Steve Fawcett
General Counsel
Office of State Assembly Speaker Robin Vos

10/10/22
Federal Tax ID 04-3597929

INVOICE #: 346465

Re: American Oversight v. Robin Vos, in his official
capacity, Wisconsin State Assembly Speaker
Our File: 98638
Claim Number: N/A

Date of Service	Description of Service	Professional	Hours
Sep 1, 2022	Analysis of Plaintiff's response brief; Began to outline reply. [L460, A104]	RSS	1.30
Sep 16, 2022	Examine petitioner's response to motion for reconsideration. [L250, A104]	JES	0.50
TOTAL HOURS			1.80

**KOPKA PINKUS DOLIN PC
INVOICE SUMMARY**

Please remit to: 100 Lexington Drive, Suite 100, Buffalo Grove, IL 60089-6937
(847) 549-9611
98638

Professional	Level	Hourly Rate	Hours	Total
Jonathan E Sacks	Associate	235.00	0.50	117.50
Ronald S Stadler	Partner	275.00	1.30	357.50
Total Time:			1.80	475.00

Total this Invoice: \$475.00



Mr. Steve Fawcett
 General Counsel
 Office of State Assembly Speaker Robin Vos

09/12/22
 Federal Tax ID 04-3597929

INVOICE #: 343790

Re: American Oversight v. Assembly Office of Special
 Counsel, Wisconsin State Assembly, Robin Vos and
 Edward Blazel
 Our File: 99017

Date of Service	Description of Service	Professional	Hours
Aug 1, 2022	Examine petitioner's Motion for determination of contempt-purge status and supporting filings. [L250, A104]	JES	0.80
Aug 1, 2022	Review Office of Special Counsel's petition to appeal non final order. [L510, A104]	JES	0.30
Aug 1, 2022	Travel to and from Madison [L460, A112]	RSS	3.00
Aug 1, 2022	Preparation for and attendance at Motion hearing on fees. [L460, A109]	RSS	4.60
Aug 2, 2022	Review order denying Motion for leave to appeal order imposing daily sanctions. [L510, A104]	JES	0.20
Aug 5, 2022	Examine petitioner's letter regarding supplemental fee application and affidavit's supporting award of additional fees. [L250, A104]	JES	0.40

<u>Date of Service</u>	<u>Description of Service</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Aug 5, 2022	Analysis of email from plaintiffs on fees; Respond to issues raised by Plaintiffs. Revise proposed order. [L460, A107]	RSS	0.80
Aug 8, 2022	Examine office of special counsel's opposition to Motion for determination of purge condition and supplemental affidavit of Michael Gableman. [L250, A104]	JES	0.60
Aug 9, 2022	Examine office of special counsel's Motion to terminate and vacate remedial sanctions and supporting brief. [L250, A104]	JES	0.40
Aug 10, 2022	Review petitioner's correspondence to court regarding proposed order on merits phase attorney fees award and proposed order. [L250, A104]	JES	0.20
Aug 11, 2022	Review office of special counsel's response to request for supplemental fees. [L250, A104]	JES	0.30
Aug 15, 2022	Review pro hac vice materials and order denying Motion to admit Attorney Gallant pro hac vice. [L250, A104]	JES	0.30
Aug 15, 2022	Review of new records request related to OSC. Update Mr. Fawcett. [L460, A104]	RSS	0.30
Aug 15, 2022	Emails to and from Plaintiff regarding its assertion that we are required to attend hearing; Draft letter to the court objecting to the request. [L460, A104]	RSS	0.40
Aug 16, 2022	Examine petitioners response to office of special counsel's petition for leave to appeal a non final order and request for temporary relief. [L510, A104]	JES	0.40
Aug 16, 2022	Draft response to Atty .Colombo re: records request. [L460, A103]	RSS	0.40
Aug 17, 2022	Examine order on office of special counsel's purge condition, order on Motion to stay, and 90 page supplement to the court's July 18, 2022 decision denying Motion to recuse.	JES	0.80

<u>Date of Service</u>	<u>Description of Service</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Hours</u>
	[L250, A104]		
Aug 17, 2022	Review Motion to supplement appellate record.	JES	0.20
	[L510, A104]		
Aug 18, 2022	Revise notice of appeal.	JES	0.30
	[L510, A103]		
Aug 18, 2022	Begin drafting docketing statement for appeal	HBB	0.60
	[L520, A103]		
Aug 18, 2022	Research standard of review for circuit court's award of attorney's fees.	HBB	0.30
	[L520, A103]		
Aug 18, 2022	Draft notice of appeal	HBB	0.20
	[L520, A103]		
Aug 19, 2022	Research and analysis as the various standards of review; revise notice of appeal. Revise docketing statement.	RSS	0.50
	[L460, A103]		
Aug 22, 2022	TCW clients and other counsel re: status of all matters.	RSS	1.00
	[L460, A106]		
Aug 23, 2022	Review office of special counsel's amended notice of appeal and related filings.	JES	0.30
	[L510, A104]		
Aug 23, 2022	Review, revise and finalize docketing statement.	RSS	0.30
	[L460, A103]		
Aug 23, 2022	Continue drafting notice of appeal	HBB	0.20
	[L520, A103]		
Aug 23, 2022	Continue drafting docketing statement	HBB	0.50

<u>Date of Service</u>	<u>Description of Service</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Hours</u>
	[L520, A103]		
Aug 24, 2022	Review proposed order awarding supplemental fees against office of special counsel and accompanying correspondence to the court. [L250, A104]	JES	0.20
Aug 24, 2022	Review office of special counsel's Motion to consolidate appeals and other relief. [L510, A104]	JES	0.40
Aug 25, 2022	Examine petitioner's opposition to pro hac vice admissions for office of special counsel, court of appeals order granting pro hac vice admission, and petitioner's Motion for reconsideration. [L510, A104]	JES	0.60
TOTAL HOURS			19.80

**KOPKA PINKUS DOLIN PC
INVOICE SUMMARY**

Please remit to: 100 Lexington Drive, Suite 100, Buffalo Grove, IL 60089-6937
(847) 549-9611
99017

Professional	Level	Hourly Rate	Hours	Total
Jonathan E Sacks	Associate	235.00	6.70	1,574.50
Herschel B Brodkey	Associate	235.00	1.80	423.00
Ronald S Stadler	Partner	275.00	11.30	3,107.50
Total Time:			19.80	5,105.00

Total this Invoice: \$5,105.00



Mr. Steve Fawcett
General Counsel
Office of State Assembly Speaker Robin Vos

10/10/22
Federal Tax ID 04-3597929

INVOICE #: 346463

Re: American Oversight v. Wisconsin State Assembly,
Speaker Robin Vos and Edward A. Blazel
Our File: 98350
Claim Number: N/A

Date of Service	Description of Service	Professional	Hours
Sep 8, 2022	Finalize notice of appeal and docketing statement identify transcripts required for the appeal. [L460, A103]	RSS	0.30
TOTAL HOURS			0.30

**KOPKA PINKUS DOLIN PC
INVOICE SUMMARY**

Please remit to: 100 Lexington Drive, Suite 100, Buffalo Grove, IL 60089-6937
(847) 549-9611
98350

Professional	Level	Hourly Rate	Hours	Total
Ronald S Stadler	Partner	275.00	0.30	82.50
Total Time:			0.30	82.50

Expenses paid by and reimbursable to Kopka Pinkus Dolin:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Expense</u>	<u>Amount</u>
09/12/22	Vendor: Rowan Thompson; Invoice#: 21CV2440; Date: 9/12/2022 - Court transcript - Oral Ruling 7/28/22 American Oversight	16.00

Total Expenses: \$16.00

Total this Invoice: \$98.50

Invoice No. 287

**INVOICE FOR TRANSCRIPT PREPARATION
BY STATE-EMPLOYED COURT REPORTER**

► Please type or print information.

County Dane	Case Number 21CV2440
Case Caption American Oversight vs. Robin Vos, et al.	Type and Date of Proceeding Oral Ruling 7/28/2022

Quantity of pages	Description	Rate per page	Amount
	§814.69(1)(a) Originals	\$1.50	\$0.00
	§814.69(1)(a) Duplicates	\$0.50	\$0.00
	§814.69(1)(b) Originals	\$2.25	\$0.00
32	§814.69(1)(b) Duplicates	\$0.50	\$16.00
	§814.69(1)(bm) Originals	\$3.00	\$0.00
	§814.69(1)(bm) Duplicates	\$0.75	\$0.00
	§814.69(1)(c) Originals		\$0.00
	§814.69(1)(c) Duplicates		\$0.00
Postage paid or charges for electronic copies (CDs, disks)			
Subtotal			\$16.00
Less credit for prepayment, county copying costs or other credit as applicable			\$0.00
Net Total Due			\$16.00

This transcript is for:	
<input type="checkbox"/>	An appeal
<input type="checkbox"/>	SPD appellate viewing
<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	Other
This transcript was requested by:	
<input type="checkbox"/>	Public Defender SPD #
<input type="checkbox"/>	Appointed SPD SPD#
<input type="checkbox"/>	District Attorney
<input type="checkbox"/>	Guardian Ad Litem
<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	Private Counsel
<input type="checkbox"/>	Judge
<input type="checkbox"/>	Other:
<input type="checkbox"/>	Required by statute

I certify that the total amount shown was computed in accordance with §814.69, Wis. Stats., and that I have not previously applied for or received payment for this amount.

Court Reporter's Signature	Date 9/12/22	County Dane	Branch No. Branch 3
Social Security Number		Telephone Number (608) 266-4308	

Bill to:	Make check payable to and send to:	Send copy of invoice to:
Kopka Pinkus Dolin	Rowan Thompson Dane County Courthouse Branch 3 215 South Hamilton Street, #8107 Madison, WI 53703	Director of State Courts Management Services 110 E. Main Street, Ste 430 Madison, WI 53703

CS-234, 05/10

}



Mr. Steve Fawcett
 General Counsel
 Office of State Assembly Speaker Robin Vos

09/12/22
 Federal Tax ID 04-3597929

INVOICE #: 343794

Re: American Oversight v. Robin Vos, in his official
 capacity, Wisconsin State Assembly Speaker
 Our File: 98638
 Claim Number: N/A

Date of Service	Description of Service	Professional	Hours
Aug 1, 2022	Review notice of assignment of new judge. [L250, A104]	JES	0.20
Aug 2, 2022	Analyze Court's order on Plaintiff's Motion for summary judgment to determine whether Court grants relief not asked for by Plaintiff [L120, A104]	HBB	0.60
Aug 3, 2022	Detailed analysis of Westerberg's letter re: compliance with court order. Draft response to each point raised by Plaintiff. Revise same. [L460, A103]	RSS	1.20
Aug 4, 2022	Revise Motion for extension of time to comply with court's order regarding records search and production. [L250, A103]	JES	0.60
Aug 4, 2022	Draft and revise Motion to extend deadline; Research re same. [L460, A104]	RSS	1.20
Aug 4, 2022	Analysis of whether the court's order exceeds the relief requested. [L460, A104]	RSS	1.30

<u>Date of Service</u>	<u>Description of Service</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Aug 4, 2022	Research whether a Court is allowed to grant relief that was not requested by a party [L120, A102]	HBB	1.50
Aug 5, 2022	Review petitioner's response to Motion to extend date to comply with court order. [L250, A104]	JES	0.20
Aug 16, 2022	Review correspondence from Attorney Westerberg regarding search terms. [L250, A104]	JES	0.20
Aug 17, 2022	Continue revisions to Motion for reconsideration of summary judgment order. [L250, A103]	JES	2.20
Aug 18, 2022	Review notice of briefing schedule for Motion for reconsideration. [L250, A104]	JES	0.20
Aug 19, 2022	Research and analysis as the various standards of review; revise notice of appeal. Revise docketing statement. [L460, A103]	RSS	0.70
Aug 29, 2022	Review Motion to vacate deadlines pending Motion for reconsideration and proposed order. [L250, A104]	JES	0.30
Aug 30, 2022	Review signed order vacating deadlines related to plaintiff's fee petition. [L250, A104]	JES	0.20
TOTAL HOURS			10.60

**KOPKA PINKUS DOLIN PC
INVOICE SUMMARY**

Please remit to: 100 Lexington Drive, Suite 100, Buffalo Grove, IL 60089-6937
(847) 549-9611
98638

Professional	Level	Hourly Rate	Hours	Total
Jonathan E Sacks	Associate	235.00	4.10	963.50
Herschel B Brodkey	Associate	235.00	2.10	493.50
Ronald S Stadler	Partner	275.00	4.40	1,210.00
Total Time:			10.60	2,667.00

Total this Invoice: \$2,667.00



Mr. Steve Fawcett
 General Counsel
 Office of State Assembly Speaker Robin Vos

10/10/22
 Federal Tax ID 04-3597929

INVOICE #: 346468

Re: American Oversight v. Assembly Office of Special
 Counsel, Wisconsin State Assembly, Robin Vos and
 Edward Blazel
 Our File: 99017

Date of Service	Description of Service	Professional	Hours
Sep 1, 2022	Examine court of appeals order granting petition for leave to appeal and related orders, including order granting Motion to consolidate appeals. [L510, A104]	JES	0.40
Sep 2, 2022	Review order granting supplemental fee petition. [L250, A104]	JES	0.20
Sep 6, 2022	Review notice of compilation of record and circuit court index. [L510, A104]	JES	0.20
Sep 6, 2022	Revise notice of appeal and docketing statement. [L460, A103]	RSS	0.30
Sep 13, 2022	Review office of special counsel's proposed Motion to stay appeals for attorney's fees issues pending merit's appeals. [L510, A104]	JES	0.20
Sep 13, 2022	Examine correspondence re: stay of fee appeal Email to Mr. Fawcett re same TCW Attorney. Dean re: same. [L460, A106]	RSS	0.50

<u>Date of Service</u>	<u>Description of Service</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Sep 14, 2022	Review amended notice of appeal regarding supplemental fee award and related filings. [L510, A104]	JES	0.20
Sep 14, 2022	Review filed Motion to stay appeal on attorney's fees pending merits and supporting brief. [L510, A104]	JES	0.20
Sep 14, 2022	Examine multiple filings and notices from Court on appeal issues. [L460, A104]	RSS	0.40
Sep 22, 2022	Examine bill of costs against legislative defendants and special counsel. [L250, A104]	JES	0.40
Sep 22, 2022	Review American's response to special counsel's Motion to stay appeals of attorney's fees issues. [L510, A104]	JES	0.30
Sep 22, 2022	Analysis of Plaintiff's response to Motion to hold in abeyance emails to and from Mr. Dean re: same. [L460, A104]	RSS	0.40
Sep 22, 2022	Analysis of Plaintiff's Motion for costs Research re: liability of individual legislator for costs update client. [L460, A104]	RSS	0.40
Sep 26, 2022	Review amended notice of appeal and related documents filed by Office of Special Counsel. [L510, A104]	JES	0.30
Sep 28, 2022	Review office of special counsel's Motion to further consolidate appeals and reply brief in support of Motion to stay attorney fee issues. [L510, A104]	JES	0.30
Sep 28, 2022	Review reply on Motion to stay fee issue. Revise reply as it relates to our position. [L460, A103]	RSS	0.30
Sep 29, 2022	Draft letter to the court re: bill of costs. [L460, A104]	RSS	0.20

<u>Date of Service</u>	<u>Description of Service</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Sep 30, 2022	Review modified order on bill of costs.	JES	0.20
	[L250, A104]		
		TOTAL HOURS	5.40

**KOPKA PINKUS DOLIN PC
INVOICE SUMMARY**

Please remit to: 100 Lexington Drive, Suite 100, Buffalo Grove, IL 60089-6937
(847) 549-9611
99017

Professional	Level	Hourly Rate	Hours	Total
Jonathan E Sacks	Associate	235.00	2.90	681.50
Ronald S Stadler	Partner	275.00	2.50	687.50
Total Time:			5.40	1,369.00

Expenses paid by and reimbursable to Kopka Pinkus Dolin:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Expense</u>	<u>Amount</u>
09/14/22	Vendor: Colleen C. Clark; Invoice#: CASE-21-CV-3007; Date: 9/14/2022 - Motion Hearing Transcript	348.00

Total Expenses: \$348.00

Total this Invoice: \$1,717.00

Invoice No. 68 - 22

**INVOICE FOR TRANSCRIPT PREPARATION
BY STATE-EMPLOYED COURT REPORTER**

► Please type or print information.

County Dane	Case Number 21-CV-3007
Case Caption American Oversight vs. Assembly Office of Special Counsel, et al	Type and Date of Proceeding 8/1/2022 - Motion hearing (116 pgs)

Quantity of pages	Description	Rate per page	Amount
	§814.69(1)(a) Originals	\$1.50	\$0.00
	§814.69(1)(a) Duplicates	\$0.50	\$0.00
	§814.69(1)(b) Originals	\$2.25	\$0.00
	§814.69(1)(b) Duplicates	\$0.50	\$0.00
	§814.69(1)(bm) Originals	\$3.00	\$0.00
	§814.69(1)(bm) Duplicates	\$0.75	\$0.00
	§814.69(1)(c) Originals		\$0.00
348	§814.69(1)(c) Duplicates	\$1.00	\$348.00
Postage paid or charges for electronic copies (CDs, disks)			\$0.00
Subtotal			\$348.00
Less credit for prepayment, county copying costs or other credit as applicable			\$0.00
Net Total Due			\$348.00

This transcript is for:	
<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	An Appeal
<input type="checkbox"/>	SPD appellate viewing
<input type="checkbox"/>	Other
This transcript was requested by:	
<input type="checkbox"/>	Public Defender SPD#:
<input type="checkbox"/>	Appointed SPD SPD#:
<input type="checkbox"/>	District Attorney
<input type="checkbox"/>	Guardian Ad Litem
<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	Private Counsel
<input type="checkbox"/>	Judge
<input type="checkbox"/>	Other:
<input type="checkbox"/>	Required by statute

I certify that the total amount shown was computed in accordance with §814.69, Wis. Stats., and that I have not previously applied for or received payment for this amount.

Court Reporter's Signature	Date 09/14/22	County Dane	Branch No. 8
Social Security Number		Telephone Number (608) 267-2529	

Send copy to:	Make check payable to and send to:	Send of invoice copy to:
Kopka Pinkus Dolan ATTN: Ashley Schuh	Colleen C. Clark Dane County Courthouse #4109 215 S. Hamilton Street Madison, WI 53703-3290	Director of State Courts Management Services 110 E. Main Street, Ste 430 Madison, WI 53703

CS-234, 09/09

s. 814.69, Wis. Stats.

}

From: Steve.Fawcett@legis.wisconsin.gov
Sent: Tuesday, August 30, 2022, 1:35 PM
To: "Hale, Janine" <Janine.Hale@legis.wisconsin.gov>; "Blazel, Ted" <Ted.Blazel@legis.wisconsin.gov>
Subject: FW: 4--Wisc.OSC Invoices 08-26-22
Attachments: Wisc OSC WEC Inv 08-26-2_001.pdf; Wisc.OSC EA Invoice 08-26-22.pdf; Wisc.OSC.DR Invoice 08-26-22.pdf; Wisc.OSC.PRR Invoice 08-26-22.pdf

These are Assembly only.

From: James Bopp Jr <jboppjr@aol.com>
Sent: Saturday, August 27, 2022 7:26 AM
To: Fawcett, Steve <Steve.Fawcett@legis.wisconsin.gov>
Subject: Fwd: 4--Wisc.OSC Invoices 08-26-22

Charges for July. Jim

From: receptionist@bopplaw.com
To: jboppjr@aol.com
Sent: 8/26/2022 3:54:35 PM US Eastern Standard Time
Subject: 4--Wisc.OSC Invoices 08-26-22

Jim,

Please see attached 4--Wisc.OSC Invoices 08-26-22

Thank You,

Debbie

From: canon
Sent: Friday, August 26, 2022 2:27 PM
To: Receptionist
Subject: Attached Image

From: Steve.Fawcett@legis.wisconsin.gov
Sent: Monday, September 12, 2022, 4:02 PM
To: "Blazel, Ted" <Ted.Blazel@legis.wisconsin.gov>; "Hale, Janine" <Janine.Hale@legis.wisconsin.gov>
Subject: FW: Billing Invoices
Attachments: American OOveright File 98350 Invoice 343796 091222.pdf; American Oversight File 98638 Invoice 343794 091222.pdf; American Oversight File 9917 Invoice 343790 091222.pdf; Vos #5 Bernegger, Peter File 99845 Invoice 343789 091222.pdf

These are Assembly only.

From: Shannon L. Chicalace <slchicalace@kopkalaw.com>
Sent: Monday, September 12, 2022 12:23 PM
To: Fawcett, Steve <Steve.Fawcett@legis.wisconsin.gov>
Subject: Billing Invoices

Good Afternoon

For your review, please see the attached invoice

Thank you
Shannon

Shannon L Chicalace | Legal Services Biller



KOPKA PINKUS DOLIN PC
100 Lexington Drive, Suite 100
Buffalo Grove, IL 60089
T: 847.549.9611 | F: 847.549.9636
Direct: 847.459.2237 | Cell: 847.562.6037

Offices in Illinois, Indiana, Michigan, Kentucky and Wisconsin
[website](#) | [vCard](#) | [map](#) | [email](#)



Note: This e-mail may contain confidential information. If you have received this e-mail without being the proper recipient, you are hereby notified that any review, copying or distribution of it is strictly prohibited. Please inform us immediately and destroy the original transmittal. Please visit <https://smex->

ctp.trendmicro.com:443/wis/clicktime/v1/query?url=www.kopkalaw.com&umid=895849ae-bc17-470d-9c6e-cb4b7777904d&auth=2f9a60ba582d6d32d49e654bdd67e4a20d760ea8-fdcc8e4ab8061a680812a2c6ce2a6c7e3722aeca for other information concerning our firm

This email has been scanned for email related threats and delivered safely by Mimecast.

From: Steve.Fawcett@legis.wisconsin.gov
Sent: Friday, October 14, 2022, 3:28 PM
To: "Blazel, Ted" <Ted.Blazel@legis.wisconsin.gov>; "Hale, Janine" <Janine.Hale@legis.wisconsin.gov>
Subject: FW: Billing Invoices
Attachments: American Oversight File 99017 Invoice 346468 101022.pdf; Vos#5 Peter Bernegger File 99845 Invoice 346466 101022.pdf; American Oversight File 98638 Invoice 346465 101022.pdf; American Oversight File 98350 Invoice 346463 101022.pdf

From: Shannon L. Chicalace <slchicalace@kopkalaw.com>
Sent: Monday, October 10, 2022 8:11 AM
To: Fawcett, Steve <Steve.Fawcett@legis.wisconsin.gov>
Subject: Billing Invoices

Good Morning Mr. Fawcett,

For your review, please see the attached billing invoices.

Thank you and have a great day

Shannon

Shannon L Chicalace | Legal Services Biller



KOPKA PINKUS DOLIN PC
100 Lexington Drive, Suite 100
Buffalo Grove, IL 60089
T: 847.549.9611 | F: 847.549.9636
Direct: 847.459.2237 | Cell: 847.562.6037

Offices in Illinois, Indiana, Michigan, Kentucky and Wisconsin
[website](#) | [vCard](#) | [map](#) | [email](#)



Note: This e-mail may contain confidential information. If you have received this e-mail without being the proper recipient, you are hereby notified that any review, copying or distribution of it is strictly prohibited. Please inform us immediately and destroy the original transmittal. Please visit <https://smex->

ctp.trendmicro.com:443/wis/clicktime/v1/query?url=www.kopkalaw.com&umid=98606c37-b000-4b7a-881f-44de41610af6&auth=8b8f40db557e52f063d04ff28867775c2b1419fe-1eb26c425132ed5d8a3a9b5c98018c46da3a04b3 for other information concerning our firm

This email has been scanned for email related threats and delivered safely by Mimecast.

From: Steve.Fawcett@legis.wisconsin.gov
Sent: Wednesday, September 28, 2022, 12:12 PM
To: "Hale, Janine" <Janine.Hale@legis.wisconsin.gov>; "Blazel, Ted" <Ted.Blazel@legis.wisconsin.gov>
Subject: FW: Wisc.OSC (4) Invoices--09-27-22 and 09-28-22
Attachments: Wisc.OSC.Doc Retention Invoice 09-27-22.pdf; Wisc.OSC.EA Invoice 09-27-22.pdf;
Wisc.OSC. Invoice 09-27-22.pdf; Wisc.OSC.PRR Invoice 09-28-22.pdf

These should still be categorized under OCS budget.

Thanks,
Steve

From: James Bopp Jr <jboppjr@aol.com>
Sent: Wednesday, September 28, 2022 9:23 AM
To: Fawcett, Steve <Steve.Fawcett@legis.wisconsin.gov>
Subject: Fwd: Wisc.OSC (4) Invoices--09-27-22 and 09-28-22

From: receptionist@bopplaw.com
To: jboppjr@aol.com
Sent: 9/28/2022 9:38:11 AM US Eastern Standard Time
Subject: Wisc.OSC (4) Invoices--09-27-22 and 09-28-22

Jim,

Please see attached Wisc. OSC (4) Invoices—dated 09-27-22 and 09-28-22

Thank You,

Debbie

From: "Fawcett, Steve" <Steve.Fawcett@legis.wisconsin.gov>

Sent: Friday, September 23, 2022, 4:24 PM

To: "Blazel, Ted" <Ted.Blazel@legis.wisconsin.gov>; "Hale, Janine" <Janine.Hale@legis.wisconsin.gov>

Subject: Fwd: Invoice for Local Counsel Services - OSC/Assembly - Waukesha Subpoena Matter

Attachments: Invoice for Local Counsel Work - Waukesha County Case No. 2021CV001710.pdf

Fyi

Begin forwarded message:

From: Kevin Scott <kevin@kevinscottlaw.com>

Date: September 23, 2022 at 4:19:40 PM CDT

To: "Fawcett, Steve" <Steve.Fawcett@legis.wisconsin.gov>

Subject: Invoice for Local Counsel Services - OSC/Assembly - Waukesha Subpoena Matter

Hi Steve,

As you may be aware, after the Bopp Law Firm was hired, I served as local counsel to Jim in the Waukesha County case wherein enforcement of the various subpoenas was being sought. I have put together an invoice for my time doing so and I believe that you are the proper person to whom I should submit it. Please let me know if it needs to go to someone else instead/as well.

Thanks much and have a great weekend.

Kevin

From: Kevin Scott <Kevin@kevinscottlaw.com>
Sent: Friday, September 23, 2022, 4:19 PM
To: "Steve.Fawcett@legis.wisconsin.gov" <Steve.Fawcett@legis.wisconsin.gov>
Subject: Invoice for Local Counsel Services - OSC/Assembly - Waukesha
Subpoena Matter
Attachments: Invoice for Local Counsel Work - Waukesha County Case No.
2021CV001710.pdf

Hi Steve,

As you may be aware, after the Bopp Law Firm was hired, I served as local counsel to Jim in the Waukesha County case wherein enforcement of the various subpoenas was being sought. I have put together an invoice for my time doing so and I believe that you are the proper person to whom I should submit it. Please let me know if it needs to go to someone else instead/as well.

Thanks much and have a great weekend.

Kevin

The Law Office of Kevin M. Scott LLC

2665 S. Moorland Road
Suite 200
New Berlin, WI 53151

PHONE: 4148998273 kevin@kevinscottlaw.com

INVOICE

INVOICE NUMBER: 32

INVOICE DATE: SEPTEMBER 23, 2022

Office of Special Counsel
Local Counsel
155 S. Executive Drive
Suite 212
Brookfield, WI 53005

DATE	PROJECT	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	AMOUNT
MAY-01-22	OSC Local Counsel	Conferences with SC Gableman; review materials for pro hac vice motions of Bopp Law Firm attorneys	0.60	\$375.00	\$225.00
MAY-02-22	OSC Local Counsel	Review, finalize and file motions to admit Bopp Law Firm attorneys pro hac vice, conferences with SC Gableman; communications with attorneys from Bopp Law Firm	1.70	\$375.00	\$637.50
MAY-03-22	OSC Local Counsel	Conferences with SC Gableman re: brief due May 4, work on same; review and edit Motion to Supplement Pleadings; communications with Bopp Law Firm attorneys re: same	1.80	\$375.00	\$675.00
MAY-04-22	OSC Local Counsel	Draft, edit, finalize and file brief. Conferences with SC Gableman and Bopp Law Firm attorneys re: same, prepare and file supplemental materials; edit and file Motion to Supplement Pleadings	2.70	\$375.00	\$1,012.50
MAY-05-22	OSC Local Counsel	Communications with Bopp Law Firm re: continuance, conference with SC Gableman re same and review of status	0.80	\$375.00	\$300.00
MAY-16-22	OSC Local Counsel	Communications with Bopp Law Firm re: Order on Motions to Admit Pro Hac Vice, communications with Court re: same; draft, finalize and file proposed Order	1.10	\$375.00	\$412.50
MAY-24-22	OSC Local Counsel	Email with Cassandra Dougherty re: continuance	0.10	\$375.00	\$37.50
MAY-27-22	OSC Local Counsel	Review email exchange re: continuance of hearing	0.20	\$375.00	\$75.00
MAY-31-22	OSC Local Counsel	Review email exchange re: continuance of hearing	0.20	\$375.00	\$75.00
JUN-06-22	OSC Local Counsel	Review filings of opposing parties	1.20	\$375.00	\$450.00
JUN-07-22	OSC Local Counsel	Further review of filings of opposing parties; conference with SC Gableman	1.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
JUN-17-22	OSC Local Counsel	Communications with Courtney Milbank; review of draft of Reply Brief; conference with SC Gableman	1.10	\$375.00	\$412.50

DATE	PROJECT	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	AMOUNT
JUN-20-22	OSC Local Counsel	Several communications with Courtney Milbank and Cassandra Dougherty; conferences with SC Gableman; draft and edit sections of reply brief	3.20	\$375.00	\$1,200.00
		Total amount of this invoice			\$5,887.50

The Law Office of Kevin M. Scott LLC

2665 S. Moorland Road
Suite 200
New Berlin, WI 53151

PHONE: 4148998273 kevin@kevinscottlaw.com

INVOICE

INVOICE NUMBER: 32

INVOICE DATE: SEPTEMBER 23, 2022

Office of Special Counsel
Local Counsel
155 S. Executive Drive
Suite 212
Brookfield, WI 53005

DATE	PROJECT	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	AMOUNT
MAY-01-22	OSC Local Counsel	Conferences with SC Gableman; review materials for pro hac vice motions of Bopp Law Firm attorneys	0.60	\$375.00	\$225.00
MAY-02-22	OSC Local Counsel	Review, finalize and file motions to admit Bopp Law Firm attorneys pro hac vice, conferences with SC Gableman; communications with attorneys from Bopp Law Firm	1.70	\$375.00	\$637.50
MAY-03-22	OSC Local Counsel	Conferences with SC Gableman re: brief due May 4, work on same; review and edit Motion to Supplement Pleadings; communications with Bopp Law Firm attorneys re: same	1.80	\$375.00	\$675.00
MAY-04-22	OSC Local Counsel	Draft, edit, finalize and file brief. Conferences with SC Gableman and Bopp Law Firm attorneys re: same, prepare and file supplemental materials; edit and file Motion to Supplement Pleadings	2.70	\$375.00	\$1,012.50
MAY-05-22	OSC Local Counsel	Communications with Bopp Law Firm re: continuance, conference with SC Gableman re same and review of status	0.80	\$375.00	\$300.00
MAY-16-22	OSC Local Counsel	Communications with Bopp Law Firm re: Order on Motions to Admit Pro Hac Vice, communications with Court re: same; draft, finalize and file proposed Order	1.10	\$375.00	\$412.50
MAY-24-22	OSC Local Counsel	Email with Cassandra Dougherty re: continuance	0.10	\$375.00	\$37.50
MAY-27-22	OSC Local Counsel	Review email exchange re: continuance of hearing	0.20	\$375.00	\$75.00
MAY-31-22	OSC Local Counsel	Review email exchange re: continuance of hearing	0.20	\$375.00	\$75.00
JUN-06-22	OSC Local Counsel	Review filings of opposing parties	1.20	\$375.00	\$450.00
JUN-07-22	OSC Local Counsel	Further review of filings of opposing parties; conference with SC Gableman	1.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
JUN-17-22	OSC Local Counsel	Communications with Courtney Milbank; review of draft of Reply Brief; conference with SC Gableman	1.10	\$375.00	\$412.50

DATE	PROJECT	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	AMOUNT
JUN-20-22	OSC Local Counsel	Several communications with Courtney Milbank and Cassandra Dougherty; conferences with SC Gableman; draft and edit sections of reply brief	3.20	\$375.00	\$1,200.00
		Total amount of this invoice			\$5,887.50



Mr. Steve Fawcett
General Counsel
Office of State Assembly Speaker Robin Vos

09/12/22
Federal Tax ID 04-3597929

INVOICE #: 343789

Re: Vos #5 - Bernegger, Peter v. Vos, Robin; Wisconsin
State Assembly
Our File: 99845
Claim Number: N/A

Date of Service	Description of Service	Professional	Hours
Aug 2, 2022	Revise notice of entry of order to shorten the appeal deadline. [L250, A103]	JES	0.20
Aug 2, 2022	Draft notice of entry of judgment to shorten appeal. [L120, A103]	RSS	0.30
Aug 3, 2022	Review and revise notice of entry of judgment. [L120, A103]	RSS	0.20
TOTAL HOURS			0.70

**KOPKA PINKUS DOLIN PC
INVOICE SUMMARY**

Please remit to: 100 Lexington Drive, Suite 100, Buffalo Grove, IL 60089-6937
(847) 549-9611
99845

Professional	Level	Hourly Rate	Hours	Total
Jonathan E Sacks	Associate	235.00	0.20	47.00
Ronald S Stadler	Partner	275.00	0.50	137.50
Total Time:			0.70	184.50

Total this Invoice: \$184.50



Mr. Steve Fawcett
 General Counsel
 Office of State Assembly Speaker Robin Vos

10/10/22
 Federal Tax ID 04-3597929

INVOICE #: 346466

Re: Vos #5 - Bernegger, Peter v. Vos, Robin; Wisconsin
 State Assembly
 Our File: 99845
 Claim Number: N/A

Date of Service	Description of Service	Professional	Hours
Sep 12, 2022	Review plaintiff's Motion to reopen case. [L250, A104]	JES	0.30
Sep 13, 2022	Outline how to respond to Motion to reopen. [L460, A104]	RSS	0.30
Sep 22, 2022	Revise brief opposing Motion to reopen. [L460, A103]	RSS	0.60
Sep 22, 2022	Draft 4 page brief in response to Petitioner's Motion to Reopen [L250, A103]	HBB	2.00
Sep 23, 2022	Examine notice of appeal Review docket re: timing and date of appeal vs. order. [L460, A104]	RSS	0.60
Sep 25, 2022	Review filed document, "notice of intent to appeal". [L250, A104]	JES	0.20

<u>Date of Service</u>	<u>Description of Service</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		TOTAL HOURS	4.00

**KOPKA PINKUS DOLIN PC
INVOICE SUMMARY**

Please remit to: 100 Lexington Drive, Suite 100, Buffalo Grove, IL 60089-6937
(847) 549-9611
99845

Professional	Level	Hourly Rate	Hours	Total
Jonathan E Sacks	Associate	235.00	0.50	117.50
Herschel B Brodkey	Associate	235.00	2.00	470.00
Ronald S Stadler	Partner	275.00	1.50	412.50
Total Time:			4.00	1,000.00

Total this Invoice: \$1,000.00

JAMES BOPP, JR.
jboppjr@aol.com

THE BOPP LAW FIRM, PC
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

THE NATIONAL BUILDING
1 South Sixth Street
TERRE HAUTE, INDIANA 47807-3510
Telephone 812/232-2434 Facsimile 812/235-3685
www.bopplaw.com

INVOICE
August 26, 2022

Office of Special Counsel
P O Box 510766
New Berlin, WI 53151

In Reference To: Legal Representation of Office of Special Counsel in WEC v. Wisconsin State
Assembly

	<u>Amount</u>
Previous balance	\$1,143.00
8/10/2022 Payment - thank you. Check No. 1002537294	(\$1,143.00)
Total payments and adjustments	(\$1,143.00)
Balance due	\$0.00

JAMES BOPP, JR.
jboppjr@aol.com

THE BOPP LAW FIRM, PC
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

THE NATIONAL BUILDING
1 South Sixth Street
TERRE HAUTE, INDIANA 47807-3510
Telephone 812/232-2434 Facsimile 812/235-3685
www.bopplaw.com

INVOICE
August 26, 2022

Office of Special Counsel
P O Box 510766
New Berlin, WI 53151

In Reference To: Office of Special Counsel v. Genrich

	<u>Amount</u>
Previous balance	\$7,233.00
8/10/2022 Payment - thank you. Check No. 1002537293	(\$7,233.00)
Total payments and adjustments	(\$7,233.00)
Balance due	\$0.00

JAMES BOPP, JR.
jboppjr@aol.com

THE BOPP LAW FIRM, PC
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

THE NATIONAL BUILDING
1 South Sixth Street
TERRE HAUTE, INDIANA 47807-3510
Telephone 812/232-2434 Facsimile 812/235-3685
www.bopplaw.com

INVOICE
September 27, 2022

Office of Special Counsel
P O Box 510766
New Berlin, WI 53151

In Reference To: Legal Representation of Office of Special Counsel in WEC v. Wisconsin State
Assembly

Professional Services

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/1/2022	CEM	Phone call with Kurt Goehre regarding Summary Judgment	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JB	Review Motion for Summary Judgment, Brief, Affidavits	2.30 450.00/hr	1,035.00
8/2/2022	CEM	CM/ECF Motion for judgment on the pleadings	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	CM/ECF Assembly Motion for Summary Judgment	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/8/2022	MM Phone conferences and emails with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding WEC briefing	0.30 150.00/hr	45.00
	CD Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding drafting section on scope of subpoenas (x2 calls)	0.30 175.00/hr	52.50
	CD Review WEC motion for judgment on pleadings and Gableman motion to dismiss	0.50 175.00/hr	87.50
	CD Review filings submitted by State Defendants' in WI Gableman EA; review for facts related to scope of subpoenas	1.60 175.00/hr	280.00
	CEM Multiple phone conferences with Michael Massie regarding opposition; emails regarding the same	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM Multiple phone conferences with Cassandra Dougherty regarding opposition and subpoenas section	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
8/9/2022	MM Review Assembly Motion for Summary Judgment	1.30 150.00/hr	195.00
	MM Review WEC Motion for Judgment on the pleadings, make notes	1.70 150.00/hr	255.00
	MM Research and review Wisconsin standards for judgment on the pleadings	1.30 150.00/hr	195.00
	MM Outline response in opposition to judgment on the pleadings	0.70 150.00/hr	105.00
	JB Review WEC Motion for Judgment on the pleadings	1.40 450.00/hr	630.00
8/10/2022	MM Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding response to judgment on pleadings	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/10/2022	MM	Review fact section on motion for judgment on pleadings, make notes	1.30 150.00/hr	195.00
	MM	Draft Fact Section for Response in Opposition to Judgment on Pleadings	3.20 150.00/hr	480.00
	CD	Review cases cited in Gableman's prior briefs related to scope of subpoenas	1.80 175.00/hr	315.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding response to judgment on pleadings	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
8/11/2022	MM	Draft fact section to response to motion for judgment on the pleadings	5.20 150.00/hr	780.00
	MM	Review Motion for judgment on the pleadings fact section, make notes	0.90 150.00/hr	135.00
	CEM	Conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding subpoena section	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Conference with Michael Massie regarding case status and needs	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CD	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding subpoena section	0.10 175.00/hr	17.50
	MM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding case status and needs	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
8/12/2022	MM	Edit fact section for response	1.40 150.00/hr	210.00
	MM	Review and research legal standard for judgment on the pleadings; conference with Courtney Turner Milbank	1.20 150.00/hr	180.00
	MM	Review case law cited in motion for judgment on the pleadings	2.40 150.00/hr	360.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/12/2022	CEM	E-mails regarding complaint	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Review and annotate motion for judgment on the pleadings	0.70 240.00/hr	168.00
	CEM	Conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding client complaint	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JB	Review Notice of Termination; email exchange regarding Notice of Termination	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB	Phone conference with Steve F.	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding client complaint	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
	CEM	Conference with Michael Massie regarding motion for judgment on the pleadings	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
8/15/2022	MM	Edit Fact section for Response to Judgment on Pleadings	0.40 150.00/hr	60.00
	MM	Review Judgment on the Pleadings Standard	0.50 150.00/hr	75.00
	MM	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding Gableman Termination	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding Gableman Termination	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
8/16/2022	MM	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding judgment on the pleadings standard	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	Look up Judgment on the Pleadings rule	0.30 150.00/hr	45.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/16/2022	MM	Review cases cited in WEC motion on judgment on the pleadings standard	0.60 150.00/hr	90.00
	MM	Review case law on judgment on the pleadings standard	0.70 150.00/hr	105.00
	CEM	Conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding motion for judgment on the pleadings	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Conference with Michael Massie regarding motion for judgment on the pleadings	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding judgment on the pleadings standard	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JB	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding motion for judgment on the pleadings	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
8/17/2022	MM	Draft memo on judgment on the pleadings standard; conference with Courtney Turner Milbank	1.20 150.00/hr	180.00
	MM	Edit Fact section in response to motion for judgment on the pleadings	1.30 150.00/hr	195.00
	MM	Draft legal standard section in response to motion for judgment on the pleadings	0.60 150.00/hr	90.00
	MM	CM/ECF New Court Filings	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	JB	Review Memo regarding Request for Motion for Judgment on Pleading; respond	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	CEM	Conference with Michael Massie regarding motion for judgment on the pleadings	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
8/18/2022	CEM	E-mails with opposing counsel regarding time to discuss next steps	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/19/2022	MM	Videoconference with James Bopp, Jr. and Courtney Turner Milbank regarding next steps	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	CEM	Conference with James Bopp, Jr. and Michael Massie regarding next steps and opposition to judgment on the pleadings	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	E-mail exchange with Assembly counsel regarding conference to discuss next steps	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JB	Phone conference with George regarding next steps	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank and Michael Massie regarding next steps and opposition to judgment on the pleadings	0.20 450.00/hr	90.00
8/22/2022	CEM	Conference with joint counsel regarding next steps	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	CEM	Conference with Vos, Fawcett, James Bopp, Jr. and joint counsel	1.00 240.00/hr	240.00
	CEM	E-mails regarding conference call to discuss next steps	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Court filing notice motion to stay	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JB	Phone conference with Kurt and Courtney Turner Milbank regarding next steps	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB	Review Motion to Stay and letter from WEC	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding Stay Motion	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/22/2022	JB Phone conference with Speaker, counsel in four cases regarding next steps	1.00 450.00/hr	450.00
	JB Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding next steps	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	CEM Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding Stay Motion	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding next steps	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
8/23/2022	MM Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding response to judgment on the pleadings	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM Research and review Wisconsin declaratory judgment and permanent injunction standard	1.30 150.00/hr	195.00
	MM Draft legal standard section in response	1.20 150.00/hr	180.00
	CEM Phone conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding subpoena section	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding opposition	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JB Review court regarding setting hearing; phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	CD Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding subpoena section	0.10 175.00/hr	17.50
	CEM Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding setting court hearing	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
8/24/2022	MM Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding edits to response brief	0.60 150.00/hr	90.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/24/2022	MM Edit Fact Section of response brief	1.30 150.00/hr	195.00
	MM Research and review case law regarding declaratory judgment and permanent injunction standard	0.50 150.00/hr	75.00
	MM Edit Standard of review section	0.50 150.00/hr	75.00
	MM Videoconference with James Bopp, Jr., Courtney Turner Milbank, Cassandra Dougherty, and local counsel regarding next steps after subpoenas are revoked	0.40 150.00/hr	60.00
	MM Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding motion to dismiss for mootness	0.40 150.00/hr	60.00
	MM Review stipulated motion to dismiss	0.30 150.00/hr	45.00
	CEM E-mail to James Bopp, Jr. regarding next steps	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Texts with Cassandra Dougherty regarding subpoena section	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Work on opposition; review whether there are any genuine issues of material fact; provide feedback and edits to Michael Massie	3.00 240.00/hr	720.00
	CEM Two phone conferences with Cassandra Dougherty regarding subpoena section and enforcement	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding research item- special counsel v. OSC	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM E-mail regarding withdraw of subpoenas and time to discuss	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/24/2022	CEM Phone conference with joint counsel regarding withdraw of subpoenas and next steps	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CEM Phone conference with Kurt Goehre regarding withdraw of subpoenas	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Follow-up phone call with James Bopp, Jr. regarding withdraw of subpoenas	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JB Phone conference with Steve regarding withdrawal of subpoenas	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	CD Work on brief section on scope of subpoenas	0.80 175.00/hr	140.00
	CEM Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding edits to response brief	0.60 240.00/hr	144.00
	JB Videoconference with Michael Massie, Courtney Turner Milbank, Cassandra Dougherty, and local counsel regarding next steps after subpoenas are revoked	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	CEM Videoconference with James Bopp, Jr., Michael Massie, Cassandra Dougherty, and local counsel regarding next steps after subpoenas are revoked	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CD Videoconference with James Bopp, Jr., Courtney Turner Milbank, Michael Massie, and local counsel regarding next steps after subpoenas are revoked	0.40 175.00/hr	70.00
	CEM Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding motion to dismiss for mootness	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CD Texts with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding subpoena section	0.10 175.00/hr	17.50

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/24/2022	CEM	Work on opposition; review whether there are any genuine issues of material fact; provide feedback and edits to Michael Massie	3.00 240.00/hr	720.00
	CD	Two phone conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding subpoena section and enforcement	0.20 175.00/hr	35.00
	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding research item- special counsel v. OSC	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JB	Follow-up phone call with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding withdraw of subpoenas	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
	JB	E-mail from Courtney Turner Milbank regarding next steps	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
8/25/2022	MM	Look up Wisconsin Rules of Civil Procedure regarding extension	0.60 150.00/hr	90.00
	MM	Draft Stipulated Dismissal	1.20 150.00/hr	180.00
	MM	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding potential stay and response	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	Draft Fact Section in Response	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding WEC Attorneys	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	Compile WEC Attorney List and Addresses, send to Courtney Turner Milbank	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding exhibit list	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/25/2022	MM Compile Exhibits, save in folder	0.30 150.00/hr	45.00
	CEM E-mails regarding withdraw of subpoenas	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM E-mails regarding stipulation to stay briefing	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CEM Conference with Michael Massie regarding stay and opposition	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Draft court notice of withdrawal of subpoena	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Multiple conferences with James Bopp, Jr. regarding withdrawal of subpoenas	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Work on withdrawals; send all PDFs to Steve for signature; multiple phone conferences with Cassandra Dougherty and with Michael Massie regarding attorneys of record and subpoena exhibits	1.10 240.00/hr	264.00
	JB Review email from Mike Dean; respond	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB Review draft Notice of Withdrawal; email exchange regarding revision	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB Review draft Motion to Stay from Attorney General; respond to co-counsel with proposed changes; review email from Mike Dean; respond	0.60 450.00/hr	270.00
	JB Revise Notice of Withdrawal; respond	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB E-mail exchange regarding withdrawing subpoenas and draft of motion	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/25/2022	JB Review draft of Notice to Court; revise	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB E-mail exchange regarding notice to subpoenaed parties and notice to court	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB Phone conference with George regarding next steps	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	CD Review and forward brief section on scope of subpoenas to Courtney Turner Milbank	0.50 175.00/hr	87.50
	CD Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding exhibits and attorneys	0.10 175.00/hr	17.50
	JB Multiple conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding withdrawal of subpoenas	0.20 450.00/hr	90.00
8/26/2022	MM Phone conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding notice of withdrawal of subpoenas	0.60 150.00/hr	90.00
	MM Draft email to send to opposing counsel of notice of withdrawal	0.90 150.00/hr	135.00
	MM E-mail opposing counsel notices of withdrawal	0.30 150.00/hr	45.00
	CEM Work on finalizing notices of withdraw; preparing for sending and filing; multiple conferences with Michael Massie regarding the same; email exchange with Steve regarding withdrawals	1.40 240.00/hr	336.00
	CEM Court filing notice joint stipulation and order	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Court filing notice status conference	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/26/2022	CEM E-mail exchange with Kurt regarding court notice	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
8/29/2022	CEM Court filing notices of withdrawal of subpoenas	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Court filing notice Order dismissing case; conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding the same	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JB Review court order; phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank; email Steve	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
8/30/2022	CEM E-mails regarding dismissals	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
8/31/2022	CEM Conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding withdrawal of subpoenas	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CD Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding withdrawal of subpoenas	0.10 175.00/hr	17.50
For professional services rendered		78.80	\$17,919.00
Balance due			\$17,919.00

Attorney Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Cassandra Dougherty	6.60	175.00	\$1,155.00
Courtney E. Milbank	19.50	240.00	\$4,680.00
James Bopp, Jr.	13.90	450.00	\$6,255.00
Joseph Maughon	0.10	240.00	\$24.00
Michael Massie	38.70	150.00	\$5,805.00

JAMES BOPP, JR.
jboppjr@aol.com

THE BOPP LAW FIRM, PC
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

THE NATIONAL BUILDING
1 South Sixth Street
TERRE HAUTE, INDIANA 47807-3510
Telephone 812/232-2434 Facsimile 812/235-3685
www.bopplaw.com

INVOICE
September 27, 2022

Office of Special Counsel
P O Box 510766
New Berlin, WI 53151

In Reference To: Document Retention Action

Professional Services

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/2/2022	MS	Attend scheduling conference, email exchanges with opposing counsel regarding same	0.70 210.00/hr	147.00
	MS	Phone conference with local counsel, James Bopp, Jr. regarding status conference, next steps	0.30 210.00/hr	63.00
	MS	Phone conference with local counsel regarding status conference, motion for amended Temporary Restraining Order	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
8/2/2022	JB	Review email exchange regarding schedule	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB	Phone conference with Melena Siebert, and local counsel regarding scheduling conference; review email from Melena Siebert to client regarding schedule	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
8/3/2022	MS	E-mail exchanges with client, local counsel, James Bopp, Jr. regarding Temporary Restraining Order compliance, review responses regarding same	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
	JB	Review Melena Siebert email regarding Schedule	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB	Review email exchange regarding briefing deadline	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
8/4/2022	JB	Review email with client regarding Compliance with Temporary Restraining Order	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB	Review email from Mike Dean regarding Motion to Clarify Temporary Restraining Order	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
8/5/2022	MS	Review, strategize for amended Temporary Restraining Order	0.80 210.00/hr	168.00
8/10/2022	MS	Research for amendment to Temporary Restraining Order	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
8/12/2022	MS	Phone conference with local counsel regarding amending Temporary Restraining Order	1.30 210.00/hr	273.00
	CEM	Conference with Melena Siebert regarding termination of Gableman and next steps	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JB	Phone conference with Melena Siebert regarding modification of Temporary Restraining Order	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/12/2022	MS Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding modification of Temporary Restraining Order	0.30 210.00/hr	63.00
8/15/2022	MS Conference regarding Gableman termination, review of opposing counsel letter regarding same	1.60 210.00/hr	336.00
	MS Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding Gableman termination	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
	MS Phone conference with local counsel regarding termination, next steps	0.40 210.00/hr	84.00
8/29/2022	CEM E-mails regarding auto delete feature	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	For professional services rendered	10.70	\$2,880.00
	Previous balance		\$17,283.00
9/1/2022	Payment - thank you. Check No. 1002554684		(\$17,283.00)
	Total payments and adjustments		(\$17,283.00)
	Balance due		\$2,880.00

Attorney Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Courtney E. Milbank	0.30	240.00	\$72.00
James Bopp, Jr.	2.60	450.00	\$1,170.00
Melena Siebert	7.80	210.00	\$1,638.00

JAMES BOPP, JR.
jboppjr@aol.com

THE BOPP LAW FIRM, PC
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

THE NATIONAL BUILDING
1 South Sixth Street
TERRE HAUTE, INDIANA 47807-3510
Telephone 812/232-2434 Facsimile 812/235-3685
www.bopplaw.com

INVOICE
August 26, 2022

Office of Special Counsel
P O Box 510766
New Berlin, WI 53151

In Reference To: Document Retention Action

Professional Services

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/1/2022	MS	Review case law regarding DR statute, pleadings	1.70 210.00/hr	357.00
7/5/2022	JB	Review Temporary Restraining Order; notify client	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB	Review email exchange with opposing counsel	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
7/6/2022	JB	E-mail exchange with opposing counsel regarding accepting service and hearing	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/7/2022	MS	Phone conference with client regarding statute, suit	0.40 210.00/hr	84.00
	MS	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding suit	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
	MS	Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding suit, strategy	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
	MS	Review pleadings, filings in PRR case	3.00 210.00/hr	630.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Melena Siebert regarding suit	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JB	Phone conference with Melena Siebert regarding suit, strategy	0.20 450.00/hr	90.00
7/8/2022	MS	Review PRR pleadings, filings, briefing	3.20 210.00/hr	672.00
	MS	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding best briefing to review in PRR suit	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
	JB	Review email exchange regarding accepting service	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Melena Siebert regarding best briefing to review in PRR suit	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
7/10/2022	JB	Review Melena Siebert email regarding statutory question; respond; review Jeffrey P. Gallant email regarding same	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
7/11/2022	MS	Attend scheduling conference	0.30 210.00/hr	63.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/11/2022	MS	Phone conference with local counsel regarding scheduling conference, case needs	0.10 210.00/hr	21.00
	MS	Research case law and statutory requirements for standing, authority to enforce DR statute	0.60 210.00/hr	126.00
	JPG	E-mail exchange regarding statute governing retention of OSC records	0.50 420.00/hr	210.00
	JB	Phone conference with Melena Siebert regarding scheduling conference; review email exchange regarding conference	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB	Review scheduling order email from Melena Siebert	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB	Review Mike Dean email regarding Temporary Restraining Order	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
7/12/2022	MS	E-mail exchanges with local counsel, James Bopp, Jr. regarding pleadings, next steps, strategy	0.60 210.00/hr	126.00
	JB	Review email exchange regarding Temporary Restraining Order and Statutes	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB	Review email exchange regarding private course of action	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
7/13/2022	MS	Draft, submit PHV application	0.50 210.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	MS	Research, strategize for response to Temporary Restraining Order	3.00 210.00/hr	630.00
	CEM	Brief phone conference with Melena Siebert regarding response to Temporary Restraining Order	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/13/2022	MS Brief phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding response to Temporary Restraining Order	0.10 210.00/hr	21.00
7/14/2022	MS Research legally protectible interest, standing issues, draft memo on issues for James Bopp, Jr. and local counsel, work on memo regarding response to Temporary Restraining Order	4.30 210.00/hr	903.00
	MS Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding response to Temporary Restraining Order	0.30 210.00/hr	63.00
	CEM Conference with Melena Siebert regarding state agency	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
7/15/2022	MS Phone conference with local counsel regarding strategy for response to Temporary Restraining Order	1.30 210.00/hr	273.00
	MS Research standing issues, review recent WI Supreme Courtt election drop box case for review of standing jurisprudence	1.40 210.00/hr	294.00
7/18/2022	MS Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding case strategy, response to Temporary Restraining Order	0.30 210.00/hr	63.00
	MS Review case law for response to Temporary Restraining Order, draft same	2.80 210.00/hr	588.00
	JB Phone conference with Melena Siebert regarding Response	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
7/19/2022	MS Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding response to Temporary Restraining Order , request for extension	0.40 210.00/hr	84.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/19/2022	MS Draft letter requesting extension for response to Temporary Restraining Order	0.40 210.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	MS Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding state agency argument for response to Temporary Restraining Order	0.30 210.00/hr	63.00
	MS Review case law on legally protectable interest, standing	2.90 210.00/hr	609.00
	JM Westlaw research on what constitutes official action in Wisconsin	0.60 240.00/hr	144.00
	JM E-mail Melena Siebert regarding research on what constitutes "official action"	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Conference with Melena Siebert regarding response to Temporary Restraining Order	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CEM Work on legislative authority section	1.50 240.00/hr	360.00
	CEM Phone calls with local counsel and Melena Siebert regarding extension; file the same; call to court regarding request	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	JB Phone conference with Melena Siebert regarding briefing	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB Review draft letter request extension to file response	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB Review order	0.20 450.00/hr	90.00
	JB E-mail exchange regarding legal research on opposition attorney	0.20 450.00/hr	90.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/20/2022	CEM	Conference with Melena Siebert regarding response	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	MS	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding response to Temporary Restraining Order	0.10 210.00/hr	21.00
	MS	Review emails from James Bopp, Jr., Joseph Maughon regarding "official action": phone conference with Joseph Maughon regarding same and research on definition of "state agency"	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
	MS	Research, draft response to Temporary Restraining Order - module on state agency, standing, exceptions to public record	3.60 210.00/hr	756.00
7/21/2022	MS	Research, draft response to Temporary Restraining Order/Temporary Injunction	4.00 210.00/hr	840.00
7/22/2022	CEM	Conference with Melena Siebert regarding Temporary Restraining Order	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	MS	E-mail exchange with client regarding Temporary Restraining Order, phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding same	1.20 210.00/hr	252.00
	MS	Research, draft Response to Temporary Restraining Order	3.00 210.00/hr	630.00
	JM	Westlaw research on what constitutes an "act" of a state agency under Wisconsin law	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	JB	Review email exchange between Melena Siebert and Mike Gableman regarding Temporary Restraining Order	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/25/2022	JM Westlaw research on what constitutes an "act" of a state agency under Wisconsin law	1.30 240.00/hr	312.00
	JM Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank, Melena Siebert to discuss research findings and needs for opposition to Temporary Restraining Order and Temporary injunction	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM Draft module concerning separation of powers for opposition to Temporary Restraining Order and Temporary injunction	3.60 240.00/hr	864.00
	MS Research, draft Response to Temporary Restraining Order	3.40 210.00/hr	714.00
	MS Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding response to Temporary Restraining Order	0.10 210.00/hr	21.00
	MS Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank, Joseph Maughon regarding response to Temporary Restraining Order	0.10 210.00/hr	21.00
	CEM Conference with Melena Siebert, Joseph Maughon to discuss research findings and needs for opposition to Temporary Restraining Order and Temporary injunction	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JB Phone conference with Melena Siebert regarding response to Temporary Restraining Order	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
7/26/2022	JM Complete draft of module concerning separation of powers for opposition to Temporary Restraining Order and Temporary injunction; send to Melena Siebert	2.10 240.00/hr	504.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/26/2022	MS	Review separation of powers module, incorporate into response to Temporary Restraining Order	0.90 210.00/hr	189.00
	MS	Draft Response to Temporary Restraining Order	2.10 210.00/hr	441.00
	MS	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding response to Temporary Restraining Order	0.10 210.00/hr	21.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Melena Siebert regarding response	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
7/27/2022	MS	Phone conference with local counsel regarding response to Temporary Restraining Order	0.30 210.00/hr	63.00
	MS	Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr., local counsel regarding response to Temporary Restraining Order	0.10 210.00/hr	21.00
	MS	Draft, finalize, file response to Temporary Restraining Order and Motion to Dismiss	3.90 210.00/hr	819.00
	JB	Review draft of response to Temporary Restraining Order Motion	0.80 450.00/hr	360.00
	JB	Phone conference with Mike Dean and Melena Siebert regarding Motion to Dismiss and revision of brief	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
7/29/2022	MS	Review email exchange with opposing counsel regarding calendar, hearing	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
For professional services rendered			71.00	\$16,773.00

Additional charges:

	<u>Qty/Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/1/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research case law, Attorney General opinions regarding DR statute	4 \$3.00	12.00
7/7/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research case law, Attorney General opinions regarding DR statute	13 \$3.00	39.00
7/11/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research case law, statutes regarding standing	18 \$3.00	54.00
7/13/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research case law, statutes regarding standing	4 \$3.00	12.00
7/15/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research case law, statutes regarding standing	4 \$3.00	12.00
7/19/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research case law regarding legal interest	3 \$3.00	9.00
7/21/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research case law regarding legislative powers, state agency, official action	13 \$3.00	39.00
7/22/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research what constitutes an "act" of a state agency under Wisconsin law	26 \$3.00	78.00
7/25/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--Continue research what constitutes an "act" of a state agency under Wisconsin law	77 \$3.00	231.00
7/27/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research case law regarding supreme court rules for citations, standing	8 \$3.00	24.00

	<u>Amount</u>
Total costs	\$510.00
Total amount of this bill	\$17,283.00
Previous balance	\$2,232.00
8/10/2022 Payment - thank you. Check No. 1002537295	(\$2,232.00)
Total payments and adjustments	(\$2,232.00)
Balance due	\$17,283.00

Attorney Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Courtney E. Milbank	3.90	240.00	\$936.00
James Bopp, Jr.	6.60	450.00	\$2,970.00
Jeffrey P. Gallant	0.50	420.00	\$210.00
Joseph Maughon	8.20	240.00	\$1,968.00
Melena Siebert	50.90	210.00	\$10,689.00
Melena Siebert	0.90	0.00	\$0.00

JAMES BOPP, JR.
jboppjr@aol.com

THE BOPP LAW FIRM, PC
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

THE NATIONAL BUILDING
1 South Sixth Street
TERRE HAUTE, INDIANA 47807-3510
Telephone 812/232-2434 Facsimile 812/235-3685
www.bopplaw.com

INVOICE
September 27, 2022

Office of Special Counsel
P O Box 510766
New Berlin, WI 53151

In Reference To: Office of Special Counsel v. Genrich

Professional Services

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/15/2022	CD	Conference with James Bopp, Jr., associates, and Mike Dean regarding status of cases following Gableman termination	1.50 175.00/hr 262.50
	MS	Conference with James Bopp, Jr., associates, and Mike Dean regarding next steps after Gableman termination	1.50 210.00/hr 315.00
	JB	Conference with associates, and Mike Dean regarding Gableman termination and next steps	1.50 450.00/hr 675.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/15/2022	CEM	Conference with James Bopp, Jr., associates, and Mike Dean regarding next steps regarding Gableman termination	1.50 240.00/hr	360.00
8/16/2022	CEM	Phone call with Kevin Scott regarding call from Ramirez court	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
8/18/2022	CEM	E-mails with opposing counsel regarding time to discuss next steps	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Court filing notice correspondence from court regarding status of case; call with James Bopp, Jr. regarding the same; email to Steve Fawcett regarding the same	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	JB	Review court notice; phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding status of case	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
8/19/2022	MM	Videoconference with James Bopp, Jr., Courtney Turner Milbank, Cassandra Dougherty, and local counsel and joint counsel regarding next steps	0.60 150.00/hr	90.00
	CEM	E-mails with James Bopp, Jr. and Steve regarding time to discuss next steps	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding correspondence from court and next steps	0.60 240.00/hr	144.00
	CEM	E-mail with opposing counsel regarding call to discuss next steps	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Kevin regarding correspondence to court	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Multiple phone conferences with Cassandra Dougherty regarding correspondence	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
8/19/2022	CEM	Review letter regarding correspondence to court	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CD	Review court request for update on case status	0.20 175.00/hr	35.00
	CD	Videoconference with James Bopp, Jr., associates, and Mike Dean regarding responding to court's letter	0.60 175.00/hr	105.00
	CD	Work on response to court's letter regarding case status	1.10 175.00/hr	192.50
	CD	Review and respond to emails from James Bopp, Jr., Courtney Turner Milbank, and Kevin Scott regarding response to court's letter regarding case status	0.40 175.00/hr	70.00
	CD	Multiple phone conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding response to court's letter regarding case status	0.40 175.00/hr	70.00
	CD	Phone conference with Kevin Scott regarding response to court's letter regarding case status	0.10 175.00/hr	17.50
	CD	Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding response to court's letter regarding case status (3x)	0.20 175.00/hr	35.00
	CD	Review and file response to court's letter regarding case status	0.50 175.00/hr	87.50
	JB	Review letter for judge; phone conference with Steve F.; phone conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding response	0.70 450.00/hr	315.00
	JB	Phone conference with Kevin regarding next steps	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/19/2022	JB	Phone conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding response to court's letter regarding case status (3x)	0.20 450.00/hr	90.00
	CEM	Videoconference with James Bopp, Jr., associates, and Mike Dean regarding responding to court's letter	0.60 240.00/hr	144.00
8/22/2022	CEM	Court filing notice WEC correspondence to court	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JB	Review defendant's letter for court	0.20 450.00/hr	90.00
	JB	Review Motion to Stay	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
8/24/2022	CEM	Court filing notice appearance	0.10 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JB	Review Court Order regarding hearing	0.20 450.00/hr	90.00
	CD	Participate in meeting with James Bopp, Jr., Courtney Turner Milbank, Michael Massie, Mike Dean regarding withdrawing subpoenas	0.40 175.00/hr	70.00
	CD	E-mail Kevin Scott questions regarding withdrawing subpoenas	0.30 175.00/hr	52.50
	CEM	Participate in meeting with James Bopp, Jr., Michael Massie, Cassandra Dougherty, Mike Dean regarding withdrawing subpoenas	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	MM	Participate in meeting with James Bopp, Jr., Courtney Turner Milbank, Cassandra Dougherty, Mike Dean regarding withdrawing subpoenas	0.40 150.00/hr	60.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/24/2022	JB Participate in meeting with Michael Massie, Courtney Turner Milbank, Cassandra Dougherty, Mike Dean regarding withdrawing subpoenas	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
8/25/2022	CEM Court filing notice of retainer	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JB E-mail exchange regarding dismissal issues	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	CD Review comments from Kevin Scott regarding procedure for withdrawing petition	0.10 175.00/hr	17.50
	CD Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding list of parties, saving subpoenas for notices of withdrawal (x3 calls)	0.30 175.00/hr	52.50
	CD Save all subpoenas to folder to serve with notices of withdrawal	0.80 175.00/hr	140.00
8/26/2022	CEM Notice of appearance, email to Cassandra Dougherty regarding updated withdrawal list	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM E-mail to Cassandra Dougherty regarding court notice of withdrawal	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Multiple phone conferences with Cassandra Dougherty regarding outstanding subpoenas; find outstanding subpoenas	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CD Draft notice of withdrawal; send to Courtney Turner Milbank	0.40 175.00/hr	70.00
	CD Combine notices of withdrawal with corresponding subpoenas	0.60 175.00/hr	105.00
	CD E-mail all opposing counsel regarding withdrawal of subpoenas	0.30 175.00/hr	52.50

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/26/2022	CD	File subpoenas and withdrawal notices for filing	0.30 175.00/hr	52.50
	CD	Review and respond to opposing counsel Letteny regarding outstanding subpoena withdrawal	0.30 175.00/hr	52.50
8/29/2022	CEM	E-mails regarding withdrawal of all subpoenas	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Court filing notices of withdrawal of subpoenas	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Court filing notice Order dismissing case	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JB	E-mail exchange regarding hearing; review draft of letter and opposition	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB	Review court order; phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank; email Steve	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	CEM	Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding court order	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
8/31/2022	CEM	Court filing notices	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding withdrawing all remaining subpoenas	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CD	Work on table of subpoenas, attorneys, and status of subpoenas from OSC website	0.60 175.00/hr	105.00
	CD	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding withdrawing all remaining subpoenas	0.10 175.00/hr	17.50
For professional services rendered			24.10	\$6,225.50

Balance due

Amount

\$6,225.50

Attorney Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Cassandra Dougherty	9.50	175.00	\$1,662.50
Courtney E. Milbank	6.20	240.00	\$1,488.00
Courtney E. Milbank	0.10	0.00	\$0.00
James Bopp, Jr.	5.80	450.00	\$2,610.00
Melena Siebert	1.50	210.00	\$315.00
Michael Massie	1.00	150.00	\$150.00

JAMES BOPP, JR.
jboppjr@aol.com

THE BOPP LAW FIRM, PC
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

THE NATIONAL BUILDING
1 South Sixth Street
TERRE HAUTE, INDIANA 47807-3510
Telephone 812/232-2434 Facsimile 812/235-3685
www.bopplaw.com

INVOICE
August 26, 2022

Office of Special Counsel
P O Box 510766
New Berlin, WI 53151

In Reference To: Legal Representation of Office of Special Counsel in American Oversight v.
Assembly Office of Special Counsel

Professional Services

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/1/2022	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding motion to recuse	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JM	Edit, revise, and expand motion to recuse	2.80 240.00/hr	672.00
	JM	Edit motion to continue; send to Courtney Turner Milbank	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	MM	E-mail from Courtney Turner Milbank regarding motion to continue	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/1/2022	MM Draft Motion to Continue	1.70 150.00/hr	255.00
	MM Two phone conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding motion to continue July 13th Hearing	0.30 150.00/hr	45.00
	MM Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding availability for hearing	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM E-mail personal counsel regarding July 13, 2022 hearing and dates of availability	0.40 150.00/hr	60.00
	MM E-mail OSC regarding July 13, 2022 Hearing	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM Draft Response to Outstanding Records Requests	2.10 150.00/hr	315.00
	MM Edit Motion to Continue	0.40 150.00/hr	60.00
	MM Review Outstanding Records Requests	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM Edit Responses to Outstanding Records Requests	0.40 150.00/hr	60.00
	MM Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding Response to Motion to Strike	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	JB E-mail exchange regarding availability for 7/13 and Motion to Continue	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB E-mail exchange regarding next steps	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/1/2022	JB Review Motion to Strike Court of Appeals Motion to Stay	0.60 450.00/hr	270.00
	JB Review draft of Motion to Continue	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	CEM Edit recusal memo; conference with Joseph Maughon	0.70 240.00/hr	168.00
	CEM Conference with Michael Massie regarding motion to continue; emails with joint counsel and Michael Massie regarding same	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM Review motion to continue; conference with Michael Massie regarding edits	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM Review revised motion to continue; finalize for filing; file the same	0.60 240.00/hr	144.00
	CEM Two conferences with local counsel regarding next steps	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CEM Phone call with joint counsel regarding recusal memo	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM CM/ECF Motion to Strike and Review the same; call to Michael Massie regarding Motion to Strike Response	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	JB Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding availability for hearing	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
7/2/2022	JB E-mail exchange with Mike Dean regarding recusal draft; review current draft	1.10 450.00/hr	495.00
7/3/2022	JB E-mail exchange with Mike Dean regarding recusal draft	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/3/2022	CEM	Phone conference with client regarding case status and needs	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
7/4/2022	CEM	Two phone conferences with local counsel regarding recusal memo	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	JB	Review working draft of recusal motion from Mike Dean	0.80 450.00/hr	360.00
	JB	Review draft of JDA; review email regarding same	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
7/5/2022	MM	Review Motion to Strike, make notes	0.50 150.00/hr	75.00
	MM	Locate rules of appellate procedure	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	Review rules of appellate procedure	0.50 150.00/hr	75.00
	MM	Review rules of appellate procedure, make notes	0.70 150.00/hr	105.00
	MM	Research rules regarding motions to strike	0.30 150.00/hr	45.00
	MM	Review rules regarding motions to strike	0.80 150.00/hr	120.00
	MM	Draft Outline for Response to Motion to Strike	0.90 150.00/hr	135.00
	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding case needs and status; needs for notices of appearance for appeals	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Draft appearances for Joseph Maughon, and Michael Massie, to be filed in appeals	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/5/2022	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding notices of appearance for appeals	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JM	Call clerk's office to discuss whether separate NOAs must be filed for each appeal despite consolidation	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JM	Conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding e-filing credentials	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding calendaring briefing/hearing dates	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	File notices of appearance in appeals for Joseph Maughon, Cassandra Dougherty, and Michael Massie	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	JM	Create timeline of various briefing and hearing dates in circuit and appellate court; send to Courtney Turner Milbank	1.10 240.00/hr	264.00
	JM	Review call from appeals court clerk's office explaining needs for notices of appearance	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	E-mails regarding JDA	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	Send Mike correspondence regarding affidavit	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	E-mails and phone conferences with Joseph Maughon regarding notices of appearance	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	E-mails regarding opposition to motion to strike; calculate deadline	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Phone call with local counsel regarding recusal memo	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/5/2022	CEM	CM/ECF Notice of Hearing	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding recusal memo	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Conference with client	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding court of appeals pro hac vice	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JB	Review Courtney Turner Milbank email; review draft motion to continue	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB	Review Court Order rescheduling hearing to 7-21-22	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB	Review Michael Gableman email regarding Recusal Motion and edits	0.90 450.00/hr	405.00
	JB	Review Michael Gableman email and additional edits	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	CD	Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding e-filing credentials	0.10 175.00/hr	17.50
	CEM	Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding calendering briefing/hearing dates	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JB	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding recusal memo	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
7/6/2022	MM	Review Rules of Appellate Procedure, make notes	0.60 150.00/hr	90.00
	MM	Locate rules regarding motion to strike	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/6/2022	MM	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding Response to Motion to Strike	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	Review case law on filling concurrent motions to stay, make notes	2.00 150.00/hr	300.00
	MM	Review case law on motions to stay, make notes	1.40 150.00/hr	210.00
	MM	Phone conference with Joseph Maughon regarding response to motion to strike	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	Draft outline on Response to Motion to Strike	1.20 150.00/hr	180.00
	JM	Review AO motion to strike; email R. Stadler whether he has previously briefed issue of when an appellant may file a motion to stay in the appellate court	0.60 240.00/hr	144.00
	CEM	CM/ECF NOA and Order	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JB	Review email from Mike Dean regarding recusal motion	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB	Review Supreme Court decision regarding fees	0.80 450.00/hr	360.00
	JM	Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding response to motion to strike	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding Response to Motion to Strike	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
7/7/2022	MM	Review case law on motions to strike	0.50 150.00/hr	75.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
7/7/2022	MM	Review case law on filling motions to stay	1.20 150.00/hr	180.00
	MM	E-mail Ron Stadler regarding filling motion to stays	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	Draft Response to Motion to Strike	5.50 150.00/hr	825.00
	JM	Conference with Mike Dean to discuss his progress on recusal motion; notices of appearance	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	JB	Review email from Mike Dean; review draft of recusal motion	0.80 450.00/hr	360.00
7/8/2022	CEM	Phone conference with local counsel and phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding recusal	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	MM	Review Outstanding Records Requests	0.30 150.00/hr	45.00
	MM	Edit Responses to Outstanding Records Requests	0.80 150.00/hr	120.00
	MM	Update SpreadSheet for Records Requests	0.60 150.00/hr	90.00
	JM	Draft response to motion to strike	5.50 240.00/hr	1,320.00
	JB	Review Mike Dean email regarding recusal motion and review draft	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding recusal	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/9/2022	JM	Edit and revise response to motion to strike	1.20 240.00/hr	288.00
7/10/2022	JB	Review Mike Dean email regarding right to counsel regarding recusal motion	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
7/11/2022	MM	Phone conference with Joseph Maughon regarding Notice of Appearances in Appellate Court	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	Review outstanding records requests	0.40 150.00/hr	60.00
	MM	Draft response to outstanding records requests	1.10 150.00/hr	165.00
	JM	Draft response to motion to strike, focusing on merits	0.80 240.00/hr	192.00
	JM	Westlaw research on when motion to strike is abuse of process	1.80 240.00/hr	432.00
	JM	Conference with Michael Massie regarding notices of appearance	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Draft segment in response to motion to strike focusing on AO's improper use of motion to strike	2.30 240.00/hr	552.00
	JM	Multiple conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding response to motion to strike	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	JM	Make final edits and revisions to pre-review draft of response to motion to strike; conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding revision	2.80 240.00/hr	672.00
	CEM	Multiple phone calls with Joseph Maughon regarding opposition and PHVs	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/11/2022	CEM	Phone call with clerk regarding PHV issue; start filling out application, per clerks request	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	Phone call with local counsel	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Review opposition and make edits	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	JB	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding recusal draft	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB	Review draft response to Motion to Strike; phone conference with Joseph Maughon regarding revision	0.70 450.00/hr	315.00
	CEM	Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding recusal draft	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
7/12/2022	JM	Conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding response to motion to strike	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Review rules and correspondence regarding appearances and whether PHV application/motion is necessary in appellate court; draft PHV forms and motions	1.50 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JM	Conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding notices of appearance and whether new PHV admittance is needed for any attorneys	0.20 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JM	E-mail Mike Dean to advise of update from clerk regarding need/lack thereof for new PHV admittance	0.30 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JM	Opt-in to efilng (also filing notices of appearance and orders from circuit court granting PHV admittance) for Cassandra Dougherty, Michael Massie and Joseph	0.80 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	Maughon; email same parties to update regarding same		
7/12/2022 JM	Edit response to motion to strike per James Bopp, Jr. and Courtney Turner Milbank instructions; perform pre-filing review; add table of contents; file	3.30 240.00/hr	792.00
JPG	Briefly review questions in email from Mike Dean regarding fees	0.20 420.00/hr	84.00
CEM	Phone call from clerk regarding PHV, call to Joseph Maughon regarding the same; review filings	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
CEM	Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding recusal memo	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
CEM	Phone call with local counsel regarding recusal memo; opposition, and PHVs	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
CEM	Phone call with Joseph Maughon regarding edits and filing of opposition	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
CEM	Phone call with local counsel regarding recusal	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
CEM	Do final review of opposition	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
JB	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding recusal memo	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
JB	Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding response to motion to strike	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
7/13/2022 MM	Phone conference with Joseph Maughon regarding records responses	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/13/2022	MM Review outstanding records requests	0.60 150.00/hr	90.00
	MM Review response to outstanding records requests	0.70 150.00/hr	105.00
	MM Edit Responses to Outstanding records requests, email to Joseph Maughon	1.60 150.00/hr	240.00
	JM Conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding case needs and status	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	JM Review American Oversight records request dated May 9; review and edit Michael Massie draft of response to same and send to Courtney Turner Milbank	1.20 240.00/hr	288.00
	JM Draft facts section of memo regarding opposition to conference allowing further discovery regarding purge conditions	3.10 240.00/hr	744.00
	JM Conference with Michael Massie regarding pending AO requests and responses thereto	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM Conference with Mike Dean regarding opposition to conference allowing further discovery regarding purge conditions	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JM Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank and Mike Dean regarding opposition to conference allowing further discovery regarding purge conditions	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	JM Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding status of memo on opposition to conference allowing further discovery regarding purge conditions	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/13/2022	CEM	Two phone conferences with Joseph Maughon regarding opposition	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CEM	Phone call with local counsel regarding recusal and evidentiary hearing question	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	JPG	Review Dean letter, <i>Friends of Frame Park</i> , attorney's fees filings, draft response to Courtney Turner Milbank	0.80 420.00/hr	336.00
	CEM	Conferences with Joseph Maughon regarding case needs and status	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
7/14/2022	MM	E-mail exchange with Courtney Turner Milbank and Joseph Maughon regarding responses to records requests	0.30 150.00/hr	45.00
	MM	E-mail Zac regarding outstanding records requests	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	CEM	E-mails regarding public records request response; review response	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Phone call with local counsel regarding memo	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JM	Continue drafting facts section of memo regarding opposition to conference allowing further discovery regarding purge conditions	3.00 240.00/hr	720.00
	JM	Finalize facts section of memo regarding opposition to conference allowing further discovery regarding purge conditions; begin drafting law section of same	2.50 240.00/hr	600.00
	JB	Review Motion for attorney fees; email Jeffrey P. Gallant	0.90 450.00/hr	405.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/14/2022	JB	Review AD brief in opposition to stay	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB	Review Stadler draft regarding attorney fees	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
7/15/2022	CEM	CM/ECF Motions for Fees and Opposition to Stay	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	E-mails with Michael Massie regarding records requests	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Conference with Jeffrey P. Gallant regarding motion for fees	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Conference with local counsel regarding memo	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Work on recusal memo; send to local counsel for filing; multiple calls with Joseph Maughon regarding the same; conference with Michael Massie regarding same; phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding same	6.50 240.00/hr	1,560.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Mike's personal counsel regarding recusal	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	MM	Review and edit Responses to Outstanding Records Requests	0.50 150.00/hr	75.00
	MM	E-mail exchange with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding outstanding records requests	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	Review new Records Requests	0.40 150.00/hr	60.00
	MM	Phone call with Zac regarding outstanding records requests, leave voicemail	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/15/2022	MM	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding Motion to Recuse	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	Review Motion to Recuse, check citations	3.20 150.00/hr	480.00
	MM	Draft Response to new Records Requests	0.50 150.00/hr	75.00
	JM	Review numerous new emails and briefly review new filings by AO	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JM	Draft law section of memo regarding opposition to conference allowing further discovery regarding purge conditions	2.30 240.00/hr	552.00
	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding case needs and status; status of recusal motion	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Finalize motion to recuse, making stylistic and grammar edits and revising arguments	3.90 240.00/hr	936.00
	JM	Conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding progress and needs for finalizing recusal motion	1.00 240.00/hr	240.00
	JB	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank; revise draft of recusal motion	1.30 450.00/hr	585.00
	JPG	Review motion for fees for contempt; phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding response	0.40 420.00/hr	168.00
7/16/2022	JB	E-mail exchange with Jeffrey P. Gallant regarding attorney fee request	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/16/2022	JPG	E-mail exchange with James Bopp, Jr. regarding <i>Friends of Frame Park</i> , supplemental authority	0.30 420.00/hr	126.00
7/17/2022	JPG	Read draft response to fees in 221cv2440	0.30 420.00/hr	126.00
	JB	Prepare for 7-21 hearing; email exchange with Mike Dean regarding hearing	1.10 450.00/hr	495.00
7/18/2022	JPG	Check files, email to Mike Dean regarding response to motion for fees for contempt motion	0.30 420.00/hr	126.00
	JPG	E-mail to, phone conference with Mike Dean regarding scheduling response to motion for fees for contempt	0.60 420.00/hr	252.00
	JPG	Review docket, draft letter regarding scheduling briefing on motion for fees for contempt motion	1.30 420.00/hr	546.00
	MM	CM/ECF New Filings	0.40 150.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	MM	Draft Response to Washington Post Request	1.30 150.00/hr	195.00
	JM	Download numerous items to docket folder	0.40 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JM	Review final, filed version of motion to recuse	0.70 240.00/hr	168.00
	JM	Finalize law section in memo regarding opposition to conference allowing further discovery regarding purge conditions; begin drafting arguments in same	1.60 240.00/hr	384.00
	JM	Review order on recusal motion	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/18/2022	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding case needs	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Locate WordPerfect version of Gableman affidavit; email to James Bopp, Jr.	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JM	Westlaw research on when it is appropriate to conduct discovery about whether purge conditions have been met	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	JB	Review Judge's Order regarding recusal	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB	Phone conference with Mike Dean regarding next steps	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding next steps	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	CEM	Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding case needs	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding next steps	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
7/19/2022	MM	Review Outstanding Records Request	0.40 150.00/hr	60.00
	MM	Draft Response to Outstanding Records Request	1.60 150.00/hr	240.00
	MM	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding response to records request	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	Phone conference with Zac regarding Washington Post request, leave voicemail	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	Text exchange with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding response to Washington Post request	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/19/2022	MM Phone conference with Mike Gableman regarding Washington Post request	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	JM Finalize arguments section in memo regarding opposition to conference allowing further discovery regarding purge conditions; complete final edits; send to Courtney Turner Milbank for review	4.30 240.00/hr	1,032.00
	JM Conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding case needs and status	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding reply in support of motion to stay	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM Draft module, for reply in support of motion to stay in circuit court case, arguing that OSC has irreparable harm	1.60 240.00/hr	384.00
	JPG Edit letter regarding scheduling, email to James Bopp, Jr., Mike Dean; phone conference with Mike Dean, phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding scheduling response	0.70 420.00/hr	294.00
	JPG Phone conference with Mike Dean, file letter regarding scheduling	0.50 420.00/hr	210.00
	JPG Research cases on fees for contempt	0.40 420.00/hr	168.00
	JPG Drafting response to motion for fees for contempt	0.70 420.00/hr	294.00
	CEM E-mails regarding Taft brief rejected	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Phone conferences with James Bopp, Jr. and with Mike regarding letter requesting appearance by Zoom	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/19/2022	CEM	Phone conference with Jeffrey P. Gallant regarding briefing schedule for fees	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Phone call with Yeoun regarding requested documents; send the same	0.30 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM	Review order on recusal	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	CM/ECF Multiple filings regarding record	0.10 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM	Phone conference with client and joint counsel	0.60 240.00/hr	144.00
	CEM	Two phone conferences with James Bopp, Jr. regarding Thursday's conference	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	Phone conferences with and Texts with Michael Massie regarding outstanding requests	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Phone conference with local counsel regarding continuing Thursdays scheduling conference and arguments	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	Multiple phone conferences with Joseph Maughon regarding motion to stay reply	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Review draft memos; prepare argument folder, send to James Bopp, Jr.	0.60 240.00/hr	144.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Mike's personal counsel	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JB	Review draft letter to Court regarding fees	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB	Review draft brief for Gableman personal counsel regarding further testimony	0.60 450.00/hr	270.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/19/2022	JB Phone conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank and with Mike regarding letter requesting appearance by Zoom	0.20 450.00/hr	90.00
	JB Two phone conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding Thursday's conference	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
7/20/2022	JM Prepare for conference with joint counsel to discuss upcoming hearing; participate in same	1.50 240.00/hr	360.00
	JM Continue drafting and finalize module, for reply in support of motion to stay in circuit court case, arguing that OSC has irreparable harm	1.60 240.00/hr	384.00
	JM Review facts section of AO brief in opposition to motion for stay; read outstanding arguments in same, annotating and formulating reply in preparation for drafting reply	2.00 240.00/hr	480.00
	MM Review Outstanding Records Request	0.40 150.00/hr	60.00
	MM E-mail request to OSC	0.30 150.00/hr	45.00
	MM Edit Response to Washington Post Request	1.80 150.00/hr	270.00
	JPG E-mail exchange regarding Judge Remington's order on hearing 7/21/2022, preparing response to motion for fees on contempt	0.40 420.00/hr	168.00
	JPG Review Wisconsin case law on fees for contempt	0.30 420.00/hr	126.00
	JPG Work on response	0.50 420.00/hr	210.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/20/2022	CEM Letter regarding hearing	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Conference with client and joint counsel	1.40 240.00/hr	336.00
	CEM Work on stay reply	1.00 240.00/hr	240.00
	CEM Phone conference with client	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CEM CM/ECF Decision and Order regarding request to appear via phone	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Phone conference with Zak regarding public records request; follow up call with James Bopp, Jr. regarding the same	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JB Review draft letter regarding alternative to Zoom	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB Phone conference with clients and co-counsel regarding hearing	1.00 450.00/hr	450.00
	JB Review Order on Continuance Request	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB E-mail exchange regarding Order	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding records request	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
7/21/2022	MM Edit Response to Washington Post Request	1.10 150.00/hr	165.00
	MM E-mail Response to Joseph Maughon and Courtney Turner Milbank for review	0.30 150.00/hr	45.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/21/2022	MM	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding Records Requests	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	E-mail responses to OSC to send out to requestor	0.40 150.00/hr	60.00
	MM	Research case law regarding Attorney-Client Privilege and records requests	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	Review case law on attorney-client privilege and records requests	0.50 150.00/hr	75.00
	MM	Edit Response to Harris Request, add portion on attorney-client privilege, email to Courtney Turner Milbank	0.40 150.00/hr	60.00
	MM	Text exchange with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding purge conditions	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	Review case law on contempt proceedings	0.50 150.00/hr	75.00
	MM	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding research on purge conditions	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	CEM	E-mails regarding joint representation agreement	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Work on reply	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	E-mails, calls, and draft/file letter with court regarding telephonic/Zoom instructions for conference	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	E-mail regarding follow up call with joint counsel; circulate call in information	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/21/2022	CEM	Conference with Jeffrey P. Gallant regarding attorneys fees response	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Work on Reply; multiple conferences with Joseph Maughon regarding the same	1.50 240.00/hr	360.00
	CEM	Phone conference with client	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	Review and edit public records responses; call with client regarding the same	0.70 240.00/hr	168.00
	CEM	Follow-up call regarding status conference	1.00 240.00/hr	240.00
	CEM	Follow-up call with James Bopp, Jr.	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Conduct research and draft arguments, in reply in support of motion to stay, concerning likelihood of success of the merits on appeal	6.40 240.00/hr	1,536.00
	JM	Call Dane County courthouse chambers to inquire about call-in information for participation in hearing	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding letter to court regarding call-in information for participation in hearing	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Edit letter to court regarding call-in information for participation in hearing	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding status of reply brief in support of motion to stay	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	JM	E-mail to James Bopp, Jr. regarding progress on reply brief in support of motion to stay	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/21/2022	JM	E-mail to Courtney Turner Milbank outlining needs for reply brief in support of motion to stay	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	JPG	Research Wisconsin law on attorney's fees as loss and damage under contempt statute	0.90 420.00/hr	378.00
	JPG	Drafting response to response to motion for fees for contempt	2.30 420.00/hr	966.00
	JPG	Research Wisconsin cases on fees for contempt	0.50 420.00/hr	210.00
	JB	Prepare for hearing	1.30 450.00/hr	585.00
	JB	Phone conference with Mike Dean regarding hearing	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB	Phone conference with Todd and client regarding hearing	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB	Attend Status Conference	1.00 450.00/hr	450.00
	JB	Phone conference with client and co-counsel regarding next steps	1.00 450.00/hr	450.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding Records Requests	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding research on purge conditions	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JPG	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding attorneys fees response	0.10 420.00/hr	42.00
	JB	Follow-up call with Courtney Turner Milbank	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/21/2022	CEM	Conferences with Joseph Maughon regarding letter to court regarding call-in information for participation in hearing	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Text exchange with Michael Massie regarding purge conditions	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
7/22/2022	MM	Research case law on purge conditions	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	Review case law on purge conditions	3.20 150.00/hr	480.00
	MM	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding research on purge conditions	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	Phone conference with Mike Gableman regarding record request responses	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	Edit Journal Sentinel Response send back to Mike Gableman	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	Phone conference and texts with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding records requests	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	E-mail Harris Response to Mike Gableman	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	Review case law on purge conditions, make notes	1.40 150.00/hr	210.00
	CEM	Work on reply; multiple conferences with Joseph Maughon regarding the same	2.50 240.00/hr	600.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding research on purge conditions	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/22/2022	CEM	Review outstanding records requests, conferences and texts with Michael Massie regarding edits	0.40 240.00/hr 96.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Jeffrey P. Gallant regarding fee petition response	0.30 240.00/hr 72.00
	JM	Finalize draft of reply in support of motion to stay for James Bopp, Jr. review	3.00 240.00/hr 720.00
	JM	Conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding final revisions to reply in support of motion to stay	0.50 240.00/hr 120.00
	JM	E-mail James Bopp, Jr. draft of reply in support of motion to stay	0.10 240.00/hr 24.00
	JM	Work to condense discrete sections of reply in support of motion to stay, to stay within page limit	0.20 240.00/hr 48.00
	JM	Receive edited draft of reply in support of motion to stay from James Bopp, Jr.; make final pre-filing revisions	2.80 240.00/hr 672.00
	JM	File reply in support of motion to stay; email various attorneys to advise of filing	0.10 240.00/hr 24.00
	JPG	Review Supplementary authority regarding <i>Friends of Frame Park</i> , email to James Bopp, Jr. regarding application to motion for fees for contempt, alternative theory of Ron Stadler	0.80 420.00/hr 336.00
	JPG	Review Assembly response to fee motion	0.40 420.00/hr 168.00
	JPG	Drafting response to motion for fees for contempt	2.30 420.00/hr 966.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
7/22/2022	JB	Review supplemental authority letter	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB	E-mail exchange with Mike Dean regarding next steps	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JPG	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding fee petition response	0.30 420.00/hr	126.00
	CEM	Conferences with Joseph Maughon regarding final revisions to reply in support of motion to stay	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
7/23/2022	JPG	Drafting response to motion for fees for contempt	4.70 420.00/hr	1,974.00
	JPG	Research Wisconsin law on evidence for establishing prevailing market rates	0.60 420.00/hr	252.00
	JPG	Research Wisconsin law on "indemnification" regarding attorney's fees for contempt proceedings	0.40 420.00/hr	168.00
7/24/2022	JPG	Research indemnification	0.20 420.00/hr	84.00
	JPG	Drafting response to motion for attorney's fees for contempt	5.90 420.00/hr	2,478.00
7/25/2022	JPG	Work on response to motion for fees for contempt	3.30 420.00/hr	1,386.00
	JPG	Edits, proofing response to motion for fees for contempt	0.70 420.00/hr	294.00
	JPG	E-mails with Joseph Maughon regarding edits	0.20 420.00/hr	84.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/25/2022	JPG	Phone conference with Mike Dean; draft arguments regarding public records vs. open records claims, failure to obtain remedial relief from contempt proceedings	1.80 420.00/hr	756.00
	MM	Review case law on purge conditions, make notes	4.10 150.00/hr	615.00
	MM	Draft memo on purge conditions	2.00 150.00/hr	300.00
	MM	Research case law on purge conditions	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	JM	Conferences with Jeffrey P. Gallant regarding attorneys fees briefing	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	JM	Review Jeffrey P. Gallant draft of opposition to motion for determination of costs and fees; emails regarding same	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	JM	E-mails with Jeffrey P. Gallant regarding opposition to motion for determination of costs and fees	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JB	Review draft of Response to Motion for Contempt attorney's fees	0.80 450.00/hr	360.00
	JPG	Conferences with Joseph Maughon regarding attorneys fees briefing	0.50 420.00/hr	210.00
	JPG	E-mails with Joseph Maughon regarding opposition to motion for determination of costs and fees	0.20 420.00/hr	84.00
7/26/2022	MM	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding Response to Purge Condition Briefing	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/26/2022	MM	Compile AO records requests into one word document	1.80 150.00/hr	270.00
	JM	Review transcript of 7/21 hearing	1.00 240.00/hr	240.00
	JM	Conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding upcoming case needs and purge response	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JM	Verify that no other items were added, during 7/21 hearing, to Monday, 8/1, hearing on attorney's fees	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JM	Locate memo from Y. Yoeun arguing no further hearing on completion of purge conditions is needed or appropriate; send to Michael Massie along with internal brief discussing same	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Phone conference with Jeffrey P. Gallant to discuss needs for Monday hearing on attorney's fees; general case needs and status	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Joseph Maughon regarding purge response and case needs	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding purge response	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Phone conference with client regarding affidavit and outstanding requests	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JB	E-mail exchange regarding next steps	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JPG	E-mail exchange with Mike Dean regarding response filing	0.30 420.00/hr	NO CHARGE

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/26/2022	JPG Phone conference with Joseph Maughon to discuss needs for Monday hearing on attorney's fees; general case needs and status	0.50 420.00/hr	210.00
7/27/2022	MM Compile AO Records Requests into one word document	0.50 150.00/hr	75.00
	MM Phone conference with Zac regarding document retention	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM Organize record request folder and create document retention folder	0.20 150.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	MM Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding OSC document retention	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM Save and download emails and email attachments from OSC to document retention folder	2.00 150.00/hr	300.00
	MM Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding AO records requests	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM Edit and compile AO's records requests into one document, send to Courtney Turner Milbank for review	0.60 150.00/hr	90.00
	MM PDF and email AO's records requests to OSC to complete searches	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM Review memos on purge condition evidentiary hearing, make notes	1.30 150.00/hr	195.00
	JM Add various docket items to docket folder; create docket sheet for hearing on fee petition for contempt motion	1.30 240.00/hr	312.00
	JM Draft arguments, facts for appellant brief	2.10 240.00/hr	504.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/27/2022	CEM	Review transcript	1.00 240.00/hr	240.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Zak regarding outstanding records requests and affidavit	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding outstanding public records requests	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JB	Review Mike Dean email regarding appeal of recusal; phone conference with Mike Dean regarding appeal	0.70 450.00/hr	315.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding OSC document retention	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
7/28/2022	MM	Draft Response in Opposition on Purge Condition Hearing	5.00 150.00/hr	750.00
	MM	Save and download OSC Document Retention	1.30 150.00/hr	195.00
	MM	Review July 21, 2022 Hearing Transcript, make notes	0.80 150.00/hr	120.00
	JM	Develop additional detail in Facts section of appellant brief	2.40 240.00/hr	576.00
	JM	Develop Procedural History section of appellant brief	2.70 240.00/hr	648.00
	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding appellant brief	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding appellant brief	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
7/29/2022	MM	Draft Response in Opposition to Purge Conditions	5.40 150.00/hr	810.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/29/2022	MM	Download and save emails and documents for document retention	1.00 150.00/hr	150.00
	MM	Review case law regarding purge conditions	0.90 150.00/hr	135.00
	JM	Develop procedural history section of appellant brief	1.80 240.00/hr	432.00
	JM	Edit facts section of appellant brief to reduce redundancy with procedural history section	1.50 240.00/hr	360.00
	JM	Conference with Jeffrey P. Gallant regarding upcoming hearing on attorney's fees and documentation needed for same	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Research when a court may presume noncompliance with court order based on little-evinced perception of non-credibility of party	0.70 240.00/hr	168.00
	JM	Review and respond to email from Jeffrey P. Gallant, locating brief filed by Assembly regarding AO motion to assess, locating document from Assembly case	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CEM	Multiple filings	0.20 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JPG	Download and review reply in support of contempt fees; email exchange with Joseph Maughon, phone call to and email from Ron Stadler regarding Assembly response	0.60 420.00/hr	252.00
	JPG	Assemble files for oral argument, email to James Bopp, Jr.; print and package, take to FedEx facility	2.00 420.00/hr	NO CHARGE

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
7/29/2022	JB	Revise draft of appeal of recusal brief	1.10 450.00/hr	495.00
	JB	Review mandate fee pleading	1.30 450.00/hr	585.00
	JB	Review contempt fee pleading	1.00 450.00/hr	450.00
	JB	Review Advisory Opinion Motion and brief regarding purge conditions; affidavit	1.50 450.00/hr	675.00
	JPG	Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding upcoming hearing on attorney's fees and documentation needed for same	0.10 420.00/hr	42.00
7/30/2022	JB	Prepare for attorney's fees hearing	1.30 450.00/hr	585.00
7/31/2022	JB	Travel to Madison, WI; preparation for hearing	4.50 450.00/hr	2,025.00

**For professional services rendered
Additional charges:**

280.20 \$72,863.50

		<u>Qty/Price</u>		
7/11/2022		Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research when motion to strike is abuse of process	34 \$3.00	102.00
		Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research when motion to strike is abuse of process	70 \$3.00	210.00

	<u>Qty/Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/18/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research when it is appropriate to conduct discovery about whether purge conditions have been met	27 \$3.00	81.00
7/19/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--review Wisconsin caselaw on fees for contempt	22 \$3.00	66.00
7/23/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--review Wisconsin statutes, cases on evidence of prevailing market rates for attorney's fees awards	27 \$3.00	81.00
7/24/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--review Wisconsin law regarding attorney's fees as damages for contempt	13 \$3.00	39.00
7/29/2022 Cost advanced for FedEx to delivery documents from BLF, Terre Haute, IN 47807 to James Bopp, Jr. in Zionsville, IN 46077	1 \$27.52	27.52
7/31/2022 Travel expense for James Bopp, Jr. to attend Hearing on Attorney Fees in Madison, WI--from July 31, 2022 through August 01, 2022	1 \$1,285.89	1,285.89
Total costs		<u>\$1,892.41</u>
Total amount of this bill		\$74,755.91
Previous balance		\$103,630.00
8/2/2022 Payment - thank you. Check No. 1002529988		(\$29,622.00)
8/10/2022 Payment - thank you. Check No. 1002537296		(\$74,008.00)
Total payments and adjustments		<u>(\$103,630.00)</u>
Balance due		<u>\$74,755.91</u>

Attorney Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Cassandra Dougherty	0.10	175.00	\$17.50
Courtney E. Milbank	34.70	240.00	\$8,328.00
Courtney E. Milbank	0.60	0.00	\$0.00
James Bopp, Jr.	37.60	450.00	\$16,920.00
Jeffrey P. Gallant	35.00	420.00	\$14,700.00
Jeffrey P. Gallant	2.30	0.00	\$0.00
Joseph Maughon	88.70	240.00	\$21,288.00
Joseph Maughon	3.20	0.00	\$0.00
Michael Massie	77.40	150.00	\$11,610.00
Michael Massie	0.60	0.00	\$0.00

JAMES BOPP, JR.
jboppjr@aol.com

THE BOPP LAW FIRM, PC
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

THE NATIONAL BUILDING
1 South Sixth Street
TERRE HAUTE, INDIANA 47807-3510
Telephone 812/232-2434 Facsimile 812/235-3685
www.bopplaw.com

INVOICE
September 28, 2022

Office of Special Counsel
P O Box 510766
New Berlin, WI 53151

In Reference To: Legal Representation of Office of Special Counsel in American Oversight v.
Assembly Office of Special Counsel

Professional Services

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/1/2022	MM Draft Response to Purge Conditions	0.70 150.00/hr	105.00
	MM ECF/CM New Filings	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM Review Brief In Support of Motion for Purge Conditions, make notes	0.40 150.00/hr	60.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/1/2022	MM	Videoconference with Courtney Turner Milbank and Joseph Maughon regarding purge condition briefing	0.30 150.00/hr	45.00
	MM	Draft Section on Modifying Purge Conditions	1.30 150.00/hr	195.00
	MM	Draft Section on Affidavit satisfying purge conditions	1.10 150.00/hr	165.00
	JM	Review email from Jeffrey P. Gallant regarding hearing on attorney's fees	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding case needs and status	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JM	Review AO brief in support of motion for determination of purge status	0.80 240.00/hr	192.00
	JM	Compile list of alleged deficiencies AO claims to exist in Gableman Affidavit; send to Courtney Turner Milbank	2.10 240.00/hr	504.00
	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding memo on alleged deficiencies in Gableman Affidavit	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JM	Edit memo on alleged deficiencies in Gableman Affidavit, narrowing breadth; send to Courtney Turner Milbank	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	JM	Begin drafting module concerning whether purge conditions were legally proper, for use in response to AO brief in support of determination of purge status	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	CEM	Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding appellate brief and purge response	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/1/2022	CEM	E-mail with local counsel regarding recusal appeal	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	E-mail exchange with James Bopp, Jr. regarding supplemental affidavit	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Review purge briefing; conference with Joseph Maughon and Michael Massie regarding the same	0.80 240.00/hr	192.00
	CEM	Phone call to Mike Gableman regarding supplemental affidavit	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Phone call with James Bopp, Jr. regarding hearing	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Phone call with Mike Dean regarding recusal appeal	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Phone call with Joseph Maughon regarding memo; review and update memo; send to client	0.80 240.00/hr	192.00
	JB	Phone call with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding hearing	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
	JB	Prepare for hearing; attend hearing; conference with Mike Dean regarding hearing; Travel	8.50 450.00/hr	3,825.00
	JB	Review email exchange regarding filing recusal appeal	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB	Review memo regarding Advisory Opinion's; review claims deficiencies in affidavit	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB	Review draft and order	0.20 450.00/hr	90.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/1/2022	CEM	Videoconference with Michael Massie and Joseph Maughon regarding purge condition briefing	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	JPG	E-mail to Joseph Maughon regarding hearing on attorney's fees	0.10 420.00/hr	42.00
	JB	E-mail exchange with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding supplemental affidavit	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
	JM	Videoconference with Courtney Turner Milbank and Michael Massie regarding purge condition briefing	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
8/2/2022	MM	Draft Section on Modifying Purge Conditions	0.60 150.00/hr	90.00
	MM	Draft Section on Affidavit satisfying purge conditions	4.40 150.00/hr	660.00
	JM	Draft module concerning impropriety of purge conditions, for use in response to AO brief in support of motion for determination of purge status	1.30 240.00/hr	312.00
	CEM	Petition for appeal; forward to client	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	E-mails from client	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Read Friends of Frame Park	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	JB	Review Court of Appeals Order on Stay; email exchange with Mike Dean	0.90 450.00/hr	405.00
8/3/2022	MM	Draft Section on Supplemental Affidavit	0.70 150.00/hr	105.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
8/3/2022	MM	Draft Section on Modifying Purge Conditions	0.70 150.00/hr	105.00
	MM	Edit Sections on Affidavit and Modifying Purge Conditions	3.30 150.00/hr	495.00
	MM	Download and save OSC documents for document retention	1.30 150.00/hr	195.00
	MM	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding Response to Purge Briefing	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	E-mail draft to James Bopp, Jr. for review	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	Review James Bopp, Jr. edits to draft	0.30 150.00/hr	45.00
	JM	Continue drafting module concerning impropriety of purge conditions, for use in response to AO brief in support of motion for determination of purge status	0.90 240.00/hr	216.00
	JM	Westlaw research to locate cases showing that a court abuses its discretion when it issues purge conditions that require action from some party other than the contemnor itself	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	JM	Draft arguments that purge conditions were not reasonably related to the alleged contempt, for use in response to AO brief in support of motion for determination of purge status	1.50 240.00/hr	360.00
	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding brief in response to AO motion to determine purge status	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/3/2022	CEM	Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding brief in response to AO motion to determine purge status	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Work on affidavit	1.00 240.00/hr	240.00
	CEM	Conference with Michael Massie regarding purge response	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding purge response	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Texts with client regarding affidavit	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Conference with client	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	CEM	Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding purge response	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JB	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding purge response	0.20 450.00/hr	90.00
	JB	Revise draft of Response to Purge Conditions	1.10 450.00/hr	495.00
	JB	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding draft Response to Purge Conditions; Review draft Response; approve	0.70 450.00/hr	315.00
	JB	Review email from client; review draft affidavit; respond	0.70 450.00/hr	315.00
8/4/2022	MM	Edit Section on Affidavit Satisfying Purge Conditions	2.60 150.00/hr	390.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/4/2022	MM Download and save documents from OSC for document retention	1.50 150.00/hr	225.00
	MM Phone conference with Joseph Maughon regarding Response	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding answers to alleged deficiencies in affidavit	0.30 150.00/hr	45.00
	MM Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding supplemental affidavit	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM Draft section on supplemental affidavit	1.60 150.00/hr	240.00
	JM Complete draft of arguments, and relevant facts, concerning lack of reasonable relation between alleged contempt and purge conditions	1.50 240.00/hr	360.00
	JM Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank to discuss needs for supplemental affidavit	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM Review and mark supplemental affidavit; conference with Courtney Turner Milbank to discuss finalizing same	1.10 240.00/hr	264.00
	JM Begin final review and edits of brief in response to AO motion for determination of purge status	2.30 240.00/hr	552.00
	JM Conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding arguments to add to brief	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Review order from Court of Appeals; emails regarding the same	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/4/2022	CEM Work on supplemental affidavit and purge response; conferences with Joseph Maughon regarding the same; conference with Michael regarding the same	4.70 240.00/hr	1,128.00
	CEM Review and edit purge opposition	3.00 240.00/hr	720.00
	CEM Phone conference with client and joint counsel	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	JB Review email exchange regarding Supplemental Affidavit	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB Review draft Supplemental Affidavit; draft brief	1.10 450.00/hr	495.00
	JB Review suggested revisions to Supplemental Affidavit by Gableman counsel	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB Review email exchange regarding Motion to Terminate; respond	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB Review draft Response to Purge Conditions	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JM Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding Response	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding answers to alleged deficiencies in affidavit	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM Conferences with Joseph Maughon regarding arguments to add to brief	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JB Review order from Court of Appeals; review email exchange regarding same	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/5/2022	MM Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding Response to Purge Briefing	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM Research and review case law regarding publicly available public records	3.30 150.00/hr	495.00
	MM Download and save documents from OSC for Document retention	1.40 150.00/hr	210.00
	JM Continue final review and edits of brief in response to AO motion for determination of purge status; add various arguments and citations, tighten language in same	3.50 240.00/hr	840.00
	JM Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding needs and status of brief in response to AO motion for determination of purge status	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	JM Incorporate suggestions of M. Dean into brief in response to AO motion for determination of purge status	0.70 240.00/hr	168.00
	JM Review email from Courtney Turner Milbank forwarding proposed brief introduction from K. Scott; respond	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JM Draft new introduction to brief, incorporating language from K. Scott proposed introduction	0.70 240.00/hr	168.00
	JM Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding revised introduction for brief	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM Conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding needs for brief	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JM Update citations to supplemental affidavit in light of changes to same; add conclusion section in brief	1.10 240.00/hr	264.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/5/2022	JM Add signature page to electronic version of supplemental affidavit; add footer to same	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Finalize affidavit, send to Gableman for signature; multiple phone calls with Gableman regarding the same	4.00 240.00/hr	960.00
	CEM Work on supplemental affidavit section of brief	0.60 240.00/hr	144.00
	CEM Multiple phone conferences with client regarding opposition	0.60 240.00/hr	144.00
	CEM Phone conference with Joseph Maughon regarding opposition to motion for determination	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CEM Phone conference with Mike regarding opposition and affidavit	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Edit, finalize, and file Opposition	2.00 240.00/hr	480.00
	JB Review Mike Dean email regarding hearing	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB Review email exchange regarding appropriating fees	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB Review Supplemental Fee Request and Affidavit	1.10 450.00/hr	495.00
	JPG Download, review letter regarding hearing on supplemental fees, download, briefly review Colombo supplemental affidavit email to Courtney Turner Milbank	0.50 420.00/hr	210.00
	CEM Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding Response to Purge Briefing	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/5/2022	CEM	Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding revised introduction for brief	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Conferences with Joseph Maughon regarding needs for brief	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
8/6/2022	JB	Review email exchange regarding Motion to Terminate	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
8/8/2022	MM	Email Courtney Turner Milbank regarding outstanding open records request	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	Download and save documents from OSC for document retention	1.40 150.00/hr	210.00
	MM	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding setting up Wisconsin e-courts account for Jeffrey P. Gallant	0.10 150.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JPG	Review emails, proposed order regarding fees, phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank (3x); review previous allocation of attorney's fees by Assembly attorney Ron Stadler, filings	2.20 420.00/hr	924.00
	JPG	Phone conference with Mike Dean regarding response to proposed order; phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank, draft language for email agreeing to proposed order; phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding same	0.50 420.00/hr	210.00
	JPG	E-mail exchange regarding \$40 discrepancy	0.10 420.00/hr	42.00
	JM	Research process for moving for excess pages for appellant brief; email Courtney Turner Milbank outlining findings	1.20 240.00/hr	288.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/8/2022	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding case needs	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Review M. Dean drafts of motion to terminate sanctions and brief on same	0.90 240.00/hr	216.00
	JM	Edit M. Dean draft of brief in support of motion to terminate sanctions	0.70 240.00/hr	168.00
	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding briefing needs and status	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Draft additional arguments and add citations in draft of brief in support of motion to terminate sanctions	1.60 240.00/hr	384.00
	JM	Conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding his review of motion and brief to terminate sanctions	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding addition of alternative arguments in brief in support of motion to terminate sanctions	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Draft alternative arguments in brief in support of motion to terminate sanctions; send brief to James Bopp, Jr. for review	1.10 240.00/hr	264.00
	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding revisions to brief in support of motion to terminate sanctions	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	E-mails regarding motion to terminate	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	E-mail with Michael Massie regarding outstanding records requests	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/8/2022	CEM E-mails regarding fees and proposed order; multiple conferences with Jeffrey P. Gallant regarding the same; review proposed order	0.90 240.00/hr	216.00
	CEM CM/ECF Supplemental fee requests and affidavits	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Review motion to terminate	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Phone conference with client regarding motion to terminate	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Phone conference with Joseph Maughon regarding motion to terminate alternate arguments	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Phone conference with local counsel regarding motion to terminate	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Review and edit motion to terminate	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	CEM Review motion to terminate; provide edits	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CEM E-mail to Joseph Maughon regarding motion to terminate revisions	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JB Review email exchange regarding allocation of fees; phone conference with Jeffrey P. Gallant; approve response	1.10 450.00/hr	495.00
	CEM Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding setting up Wisconsin e-courts account for Jeffrey P. Gallant	0.10 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding case needs	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/8/2022	CEM	Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding briefing needs and status	0.10 240.00/hr 24.00
	JB	Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding his review of motion and brief to terminate sanctions	0.10 450.00/hr 45.00
8/9/2022	JPG	Review latest proposed order on fees from Aug. 1 hearing; phone conference and emails with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding changes and whether to include "disclaimer" language in response to attorney Packard; follow up regarding Stadler advice	0.60 420.00/hr 252.00
	JPG	Drafting response to supplemental fee request	3.10 420.00/hr 1,302.00
	JM	Review James Bopp, Jr. revised version of brief in support of motion to terminate sanctions	0.50 240.00/hr 120.00
	JM	Conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding his revision of brief in support of motion to terminate sanctions	0.10 240.00/hr 24.00
	JM	Edit James Bopp, Jr. revised version of brief in support of motion to terminate sanctions; add section requested by James Bopp, Jr.	2.10 240.00/hr 504.00
	JM	Conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding finalizing brief in support of motion to terminate sanctions	0.30 240.00/hr 72.00
	JM	Prepare motion to terminate sanctions, brief in support of same for filing; file same	0.20 240.00/hr 48.00
	JM	E-mail OSC attorneys regarding filing of motion to terminate sanctions	0.20 240.00/hr 48.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/9/2022	JM E-mail M. Dean regarding moving for additional pages for appellate brief	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	JM Create oral arguments folder for hearing on AO motion to determine purge conditions, OSC motion to terminate purge conditions, OSC motion for stay, populating with relevant briefing	0.90 240.00/hr	216.00
	CEM Review Motion to Terminate; edit; provide feedback	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM E-mails regarding proposed order	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM E-mails regarding motion to terminate	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM E-mail regarding Jeffrey P. Gallant pro hac vice	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM E-mails regarding fees proposed order	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Phone conference with Joseph Maughon regarding appellate brief	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Phone conferences with Joseph Maughon regarding motion to terminate	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	JB Revise draft Motion to Terminate	0.60 450.00/hr	270.00
	JB Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding revision of brief in support of motion to terminate sanctions	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
	CEM Conference and emails with Jeffrey P. Gallant regarding attorney fees response	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/9/2022	JM Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding appellate brief	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
8/10/2022	JM Populate oral arguments folder for hearing on AO motion to determine purge conditions, OSC motion to terminate purge conditions, and OSC motion for stay, with relevant caselaw	1.90 240.00/hr	456.00
	JM Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding need to reduce length of appellate brief draft	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM Reduce length of appellate brief draft's section regarding "specificity" of denial	1.10 240.00/hr	264.00
	CEM E-mail with James Bopp, Jr. regarding next steps	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JB E-mail with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding next steps	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
	CEM Review opposition to supplemental request for fees; respond	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	CEM CM/ECF Proposed Order on Fees and accompanying letter	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM CM/ECF Motion to Terminate Remedial Sanctions	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Review response to public records request; provide feedback to Michael Massie	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding appellate brief status and needs/reducing length	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding oral argument folder	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/10/2022	JB	Review pleading regarding supplemental attorneys fees	1.10 450.00/hr 495.00
	JPG	Drafting response to supplemental fee request	4.60 420.00/hr 1,932.00
	JPG	Prepare folder of documents for August 16 hearing	0.40 420.00/hr NO CHARGE
	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding oral argument folder	0.10 240.00/hr 24.00
8/11/2022	JM	Continue reducing "specificity" section of appellate brief draft	1.20 240.00/hr 288.00
	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding needs for appellate brief	0.10 240.00/hr 24.00
	JM	Review appellate brief draft, considering which arguments deserve more attention and which less	0.40 240.00/hr 96.00
	JM	Edit appellate brief draft to greatly reduce length of section concerning statutory exception	3.40 240.00/hr 816.00
	CEM	CM/ECF Opposition to Supplemental Request for Fees	0.10 240.00/hr 24.00
	CEM	E-mail exchange regarding Jeffrey P. Gallant's pro hac vice	0.20 240.00/hr 48.00
	CEM	Review emails from Mike and Joseph Maughon regarding page limits for appellate brief	0.20 240.00/hr 48.00
	CEM	Review current draft of appellate brief; provide feedback to Joseph Maughon	0.40 240.00/hr 96.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/11/2022	CEM	E-mails from Gableman regarding complaint; review; email to James Bopp, Jr. regarding the same	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CEM	Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding appellate brief	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
8/12/2022	JM	Review appellate rules for reply brief	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JM	Pre-write appellant reply brief segment concerning AG Opinion's lack of persuasive value	1.00 240.00/hr	240.00
	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding oral argument folder	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	JM	Read and annotate <i>Friends of Frame Park</i> Wisconsin Supreme Court decision regarding common-law exception to disclosure	1.20 240.00/hr	288.00
	JM	Draft section discussing <i>Friends of Frame Park</i> , Wisconsin Supreme Court case, in appellate brief	0.80 240.00/hr	192.00
	JM	Draft and edit arguments concerning common law exception to public records disclosure	1.00 240.00/hr	240.00
	CEM	CM/ECF Motion for PHV	0.10 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM	Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding oral argument folder; check the same; send to James Bopp, Jr.	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Gableman	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/12/2022	CEM Set up and send out call-in information	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM E-mail regarding termination	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Phone conference with Joseph Maughon regarding termination of Gableman	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding meeting Monday	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JB Review opposing counsel email regarding Notice of Termination; email exchange with co-counsel	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JM Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding termination of Gableman	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JB Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding meeting Monday	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
8/13/2022	JB Preparation for Oral Argument	1.50 450.00/hr	675.00
8/15/2022	MM Download and save documents from OSC for Document Retention	1.50 150.00/hr	225.00
	MM Organize documents in Document Retention Folder	2.20 150.00/hr	330.00
	JM Download and read order denying pro-hac-vice admittance of Jeffrey P. Gallant	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JM Conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding appellate brief	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	JM Edit facts section of appellate brief, reducing length significantly	3.20 240.00/hr	768.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/15/2022	JB Review Order declining Jeffrey P. Gallant pro hac vice; email exchange with Jeffrey P. Gallant	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB Preparation for hearing; travel; preparation for hearing	4.50 450.00/hr	2,025.00
	CEM Letter from AO regarding termination of Gableman, emails regarding the same	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM E-mails regarding call on Tuesday	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM E-mail regarding call today to discuss next steps	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Court filing notice denying Gallant PHV; emails regarding the same	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Two conferences with Joseph Maughon regarding appellate brief facts	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	CEM E-mails and Court filing notices regarding hearing tomorrow	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	JPG Draft list of attorneys/staff Advisory Opinion billed for Mandamus, Contempt, and Supplemental fee proceedings	1.20 420.00/hr	504.00
	JPG Review Order declining pro hac vice; email exchange with James Bopp, Jr.	0.30 420.00/hr	126.00
8/16/2022	MM Organize Document Retention Folder	1.50 150.00/hr	225.00
	JB Preparation for hearing; conference with Mike Dean; attend hearing; conference with S. Fawcett; phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding hearing; travel	8.50 450.00/hr	3,825.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/16/2022	CEM E-mail exchange regarding agreements	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Listen to hearing	1.40 240.00/hr	336.00
	CEM Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding case status and needs	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding hearing and next steps	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Court filing notice letter from Stadler regarding fees	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM Edit and revise facts section of appellate brief	3.90 240.00/hr	936.00
	JM Review various articles concerning termination of Gableman for citation use in appellate brief	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	JM Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding case needs and status	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM Watch first half of hearing on purge status and attorney's fees	0.70 240.00/hr	168.00
8/17/2022	JB Review Order and Supplemental Brief	1.50 450.00/hr	675.00
	JB Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank, Mike Gableman and Todd regarding next steps	0.80 450.00/hr	360.00
	JB Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding Order	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	CEM Court filing notice Order denying motion to stay	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/17/2022	CEM	E-mails regarding conference with Mike's personal counsel	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Court filing notice Order finding OSC has purged contempt; review the same	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Court filing notice Supplemental Order on recusal; review the same	1.20 240.00/hr	288.00
	CEM	Conference with James Bopp, Jr., Mike, and his personal counsel	0.80 240.00/hr	192.00
	CEM	E-mail orders to joint counsel	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding courts orders	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Joseph Maughon regarding appellate brief; supplemental recusal opinion and purge order	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Conference with Mike Dean regarding next steps and call to discuss the same	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Set up and send out call in information for call tomorrow	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Reduce length of facts section of appellate brief; add pertinent details to same	2.10 240.00/hr	504.00
	JM	Research standard of review for appeal of contempt finding and imposition of sanctions	1.10 240.00/hr	264.00
	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding appellate brief, supplemental recusal opinion, and purge decision	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/17/2022	JM	Begin reading supplement to denial of motion to recuse	1.20 240.00/hr	288.00
	JM	Draft appellate brief segment discussing standard of review for contempt finding and imposition of sanctions	1.40 240.00/hr	336.00
	JM	Watch second half of hearing on purge status and attorney's fees	0.70 240.00/hr	168.00
8/18/2022	JB	Phone conference with associates and Mike Dean regarding next steps and appeal	2.30 450.00/hr	1,035.00
	MM	Videoconference with Joint and Local Counsel regarding next steps	2.30 150.00/hr	345.00
	MM	Draft Motion for Pro Hac Vice Admission	1.30 150.00/hr	195.00
	MM	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding Pro Hac Vice Admissions	0.30 150.00/hr	45.00
	MM	Fill out applications for admission pro hac vice	0.80 150.00/hr	120.00
	MM	Make edits to motion for Pro Hac Vice Admission	1.20 150.00/hr	180.00
	CEM	Finish reading supplemental decision on recusal	1.00 240.00/hr	240.00
	CEM	Conference with local counsel and BLF attorneys regarding case status and needs; appeals; next steps	2.30 240.00/hr	552.00
	CEM	Review motion for PHV; conference with Michael Massie regarding edits; make edits to motion	0.90 240.00/hr	216.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/18/2022	CEM Court filing notice documents 426 and 427	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Review NOA from local counsel; respond	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JM Finish reading, annotate supplement to denial of motion to recuse	1.30 240.00/hr	312.00
	JM Conference with attorneys on case to discuss and strategize next steps in case	2.30 240.00/hr	552.00
	JM Research caselaw and Supreme Court (Wis.) Rules regarding requirement of notice for PHV revocation; send email to OSC attorneys regarding same	0.70 240.00/hr	168.00
	JM Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding motion to consolidate	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM Draft motion to consolidate; send to Courtney Turner Milbank	2.90 240.00/hr	696.00
	JM Westlaw research on Wisconsin law on consolidation	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CD Participate in meeting with James Bopp, Jr., Mike Dean, and associates regarding supplemental decision on recusal and PHV revocation order	2.30 175.00/hr	402.50
	CD Begin drafting letter to court of appeal regarding pro hac vice admission	0.80 175.00/hr	140.00
	CD Review Wis. SCR 10.03(4)(b) forwarded by Joseph Maughon	0.10 175.00/hr	17.50
	JB Review research on pro hac vice termination, assembly and rules	0.70 450.00/hr	315.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/18/2022	CEM	Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding motion to consolidate	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
8/19/2022	MM	Videoconference with James Bopp, Jr. and Courtney Turner Milbank regarding next steps and appeal	0.30 150.00/hr	45.00
	MM	Phone conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding assignments	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding edits to motion to consolidate	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	Edit Motion to Consolidate	1.60 150.00/hr	240.00
	MM	Draft Pro Hac Vice Motions	1.90 150.00/hr	285.00
	CEM	Conference with James Bopp, Jr. and Michael Massie regarding appeal and next steps	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	Review motion to consolidate; discuss edits with Michael Massie	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding issues on Appeal	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	E-mails regarding Motion for pro hac vice; review James Bopp, Jr.'s edits	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Make edits to motion to consolidate; send to James Bopp, Jr. for review	0.90 240.00/hr	216.00
	CEM	Court filing notice Sloan pro hac vice	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JB	Review draft documentary statement; purpose revision	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/19/2022	JB Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding issues on appeal	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
	JB Revise pro hac vice motion	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB Review draft documentary statement and approve	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB Revise draft pro hac vice motion in Court of Appeals	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB Review draft Motion to Consolidate; approve	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	CEM Phone conferences with Michael Massie regarding assignments	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JB Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank and Michael Massie regarding appeal and next steps	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
8/20/2022	JB E-mail Mike Dean regarding filing appeal; review final draft of documentary statement; approve	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
8/22/2022	MM Review Courtney Turner Milbank pro hac vice Motion, send to Courtney Turner Milbank for review	0.30 150.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	MM Draft pro hac vice Motions	1.80 150.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	MM Edit Courtney Turner Milbank pro hac vice	0.30 150.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	MM Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding word count	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/22/2022	MM Calculate word count for use in motion to consolidate	0.60 150.00/hr	90.00
	MM Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding Motion to Consolidate	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM Review Motion to Consolidate, send to James Bopp, Jr. for review	1.10 150.00/hr	165.00
	MM Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding pro hac vice Motions and motion to consolidate	0.20 150.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	MM Review pro hac vice Motions	0.80 150.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM Multiple emails regarding NOA, docketing statement, and motion to consolidate	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM Work on motion to consolidate	1.50 240.00/hr	360.00
	CEM Review motion for PHV; provide feedback to Michael Massie	0.20 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM Two phone conferences with Michael Massie regarding motion to consolidate/word count	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Phone conference with local counsel regarding appeal and motion to consolidate	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Two phone conferences with Cassandra Dougherty regarding letter to Court	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM E-mail with James Bopp, Jr. regarding final edits to motion to consolidate	0.10 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM Finalize PHVs for filing	0.70 240.00/hr	168.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/22/2022	CEM E-mails with local counsel regarding NOA	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM E-mails regarding PHV applications	0.20 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CD Review motions for pro hac admission to court of appeal for information on admitted courts, language on specialties of BLF for letter to court regarding PHV admission	0.40 175.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CD Work on letter to Court of Appeals regarding PHV admission	0.80 175.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CD Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding letter to court regarding PHV admission (x2)	0.20 175.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CD Review and send letter to Court of Appeals regarding PHV admission to Courtney Turner Milbank for review	0.30 175.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JB Review draft Motion to Consolidate; approve	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB Phone conference with Mike Dean regarding next steps	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB Review letter from opposing counsel; phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding letter	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB E-mail exchange with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding final edits to motion to consolidate	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
	CEM Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding letter	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/22/2022	CEM	Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding pro hac vice Motions and motion to consolidate	0.20 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
8/23/2022	MM	Draft Pro Hac Vice Motions for new appeal number	0.40 150.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	MM	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding pro hac vice letter to court	0.10 150.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	MM	Fill out pro hac vice applications for new appeal number	0.60 150.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding case needs	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Complete Motion for pro hac vice; send to Michael Massie for filing	0.50 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JM	Perform final edits on motion to consolidate; send to James Bopp, Jr. for final approval	0.90 240.00/hr	216.00
	JM	Complete application for Pro hac vice admittance; send to Michael Massie for filing	0.20 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding case needs and status	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Research whether Supreme Court (Wis.) Rules discuss effect in appellate court of Pro hac vice revocation in lower court	0.30 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JM	Westlaw research on whether caselaw addresses effect in appellate court of Pro hac vice revocation in lower court	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	JM	Revise motion to consolidate, removing erroneous name, and send to M. Dean for filing	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/23/2022	JM Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding research item	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM Draft memo concerning whether judge can be "judge of his own case" in motion to recuse, focusing on revocation of Pro hac vice admittance and finding of sanctionable conduct	0.90 240.00/hr	216.00
	JM Conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding legal research item regarding pro hac vice revocation	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Court filing notice various filings	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Edit letter regarding PHV	1.00 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM Two phone conferences with Joseph Maughon regarding case needs	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Two phone conferences with local counsel regarding PHV letter to court; emails regarding the same	0.30 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding PHV letter to court	0.10 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM Review final motion to consolidate; phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding the same	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Incorporate James Bopp, Jr.'s edits into PHV letter; send to James Bopp, Jr. for review	0.50 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding PHV letter revision	0.10 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
8/23/2022	CEM	Review rules on tolling of briefing	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Finalize motion to consolidate; send to local counsel for filing; call regarding the same	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Joseph Maughon regarding research item	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JB	Revise letter to Court of Appeals regarding pro hac vice admission; email to associates regarding revision	0.50 450.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JB	E-mail exchange regarding Westerberg letter and next steps	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB	Revise draft letter to Court of Appeals; phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding revision	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB	Revise Motion to Consolidate; conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding same	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB	Review order on attorney fees; email exchange with co-counsel	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB	Phone conference with Joseph Maughon regarding legal research issue regarding pro hac vice revocation	0.20 450.00/hr	90.00
	JB	E-mail exchange regarding filing appeal of attorney fee order	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
8/24/2022	JM	Westlaw research to locate cases on whether, in any circumstance, judge must refer any aspect of recusal determination to different judge	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/24/2022	JM Review <i>Valdez v. Valdez</i> , case concerning propriety of contempt findings analogous to "sanctionable conduct" finding	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	JM Review recusal order supplement in preparation to complete memo concerning whether Wisconsin law permits judge to be "judge of his own case"	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	JM Continue drafting memo concerning whether judge can be "judge of his own case" in motion to recuse, focusing on revocation of PHV admittance and finding of sanctionable conduct; send to Courtney Turner Milbank and James Bopp, Jr. for review	1.50 240.00/hr	360.00
	JM Review <i>Filppula-McArthur</i> case concerning when PHV admittance may be revoked, procedure for revocation	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	JM Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding need to research status of client's existence following termination of Special Counsel Gableman	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM Review <i>State v. Henley</i> and <i>Storms v. Action Wisconsin Inc.</i> , concerning whether judge may rule on motion to recuse himself	0.80 240.00/hr	192.00
	JM Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding need to research OSC status and custodian	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM Westlaw research on lawsuit ramifications of termination of head of governmental entity	1.30 240.00/hr	312.00
	JM Review resolution and ballots creating OSC and its Investigation	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/24/2022	CEM	E-mail regarding PHV letter to court	0.10 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM	E-mails regarding fee order and NOA; calendar the same	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	E-mails and files regarding metadata	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Review memo on sanctions/contempt; phone conference with Joseph Maughon regarding the same	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding need to research status of client's existence following termination of Special Counsel Gableman	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding need to research OSC status and custodian	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding memo on sanctions/contempt	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
8/25/2022	MM	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding appeal docket dropbox	0.10 150.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	MM	E-mail Mike Dean regarding appeal docket dropbox	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	Copy files in dropbox over to appeal dropbox	0.80 150.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM	Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding effect of termination of Gableman	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Review contracts with Gableman to explore effect of termination	0.60 240.00/hr	144.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/25/2022	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding effect of termination of Gableman	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Locate and download Assembly Rules; email same, and OSC enabling documents, to Courtney Turner Milbank	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JM	Review Assembly Rules to verify authority of Speaker Vos to authorize OSC counsel actions	0.90 240.00/hr	216.00
	JM	Draft memo regarding effect of Gableman termination on OSC	2.20 240.00/hr	528.00
	JM	Review email from James Bopp, Jr. discussing strategy for appeal	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Compare recusal brief and recusal order supplement to identify errors in either	0.70 240.00/hr	168.00
	JB	Review Joseph Maughon memo regarding recusal and sanction; respond	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding appeal docket dropbox	0.10 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JB	E-mail to Joseph Maughon discussing strategy for appeal	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
8/26/2022	MM	Compile Pro Hac Vice Applications into one folder	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	Review Pro Hac Vice motions	0.30 150.00/hr	45.00
	MM	Review Pro Hac Vice Applications and Motions, email to Mike Dean for filing	0.60 150.00/hr	90.00
	CEM	E-mails regarding PHV	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/26/2022	CEM Review Motion to Supplement the Record	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM E-mails with Steve regarding withdrawal of subpoenas	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Court filing notice granting PHV	0.10 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM Court filing notice opposition to PHV	0.20 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM E-mail regarding Dougherty PHV	0.20 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding memo to address client issue	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM E-mail regarding PHV application	0.10 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JM Continue reviewing Assembly Rules to determine what they indicate about who becomes representative of OSC following termination of Special Counsel Gableman	0.60 240.00/hr	144.00
	JM Review and respond to email from Michael Massie regarding PHV admission	0.10 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JM Westlaw research on effect of office subject to public records requests having no staff	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	JM Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding needs in determining status of and responsibilities toward OSC	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	JM Research representation of entities with no staff or employees	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/26/2022	JM	Westlaw research on representation of entities with no staff or employees	0.70 240.00/hr	168.00
	JM	Research reported statements regarding creation of OSC	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM	Review Second Amendment to IC Agreement; compare termination provision to termination language in IC Agreement and First Amendment	1.30 240.00/hr	312.00
	JM	Continue drafting memo regarding effect of Gableman termination on OSC	0.80 240.00/hr	192.00
	JB	Review AO opposition to pro hac vice; review court order granting pro hac vice	0.40 450.00/hr	NO CHARGE
8/29/2022	MM	Download new docket filings from dropbox	0.40 150.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	MM	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding Appellant Brief Fact Section and opting-in	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	Review Gableman Enabling Documents for indemnification provisions	0.90 150.00/hr	135.00
	MM	Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding Gableman Indemnification Agreement	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	JM	Complete memo describing status of OSC, and duly authorized representative thereof, absent employees; send to Courtney Turner Milbank	2.30 240.00/hr	552.00
	JM	Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank to discuss needs for appellant brief	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/29/2022	JM Review Wisc. Rules of Professional Conduct; email Courtney Turner Milbank regarding segments of same pertinent to representing client whose head has been terminated	1.40 240.00/hr	336.00
	JM Westlaw research on effect of dissolution of entity on legal representation of entity	0.70 240.00/hr	168.00
	JM Two conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding memo describing status of OSC, and duly authorized representative thereof, absent employees	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JM Draft discussion of professional responsibilities in memo regarding effect of Gableman termination on OSC	1.20 240.00/hr	288.00
	CEM Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding appellate brief	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Follow-up call with Michael Massie regarding facts and opting in	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM E-mail exchange with Yeoun regarding referral	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Conference with Michael Massie regarding indemnification; review indemnification agreement; conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding the same; draft summary email regarding Assembly obligations	0.80 240.00/hr	192.00
	CEM Review memo; two conferences with Joseph Maughon regarding the same	0.70 240.00/hr	168.00
	CEM Conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding authorizing documents and next steps	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/29/2022	JB Phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding OSC	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding indemnification	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
8/30/2022	MM Outline Appellant Brief Fact Section	2.40 150.00/hr	360.00
	MM Draft Appellant Brief Fact Section	1.20 150.00/hr	180.00
	JM Conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding professional responsibilities relating to OSC	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	JM Continue drafting discussion of professional responsibilities in memo regarding effect of Gableman termination on OSC	2.80 240.00/hr	672.00
	JM Conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding new retainer agreement	0.80 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JM Review authorizing documentation of OSC and appurtenant contracts to verify Speaker Vos is duly authorized constituent and may authorize hiring legal counsel for OSC	1.30 240.00/hr	312.00
	CEM Research rules of professional conduct and obligations; multiple conferences with Joseph Maughon regarding the same and new retainer agreement	2.20 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM Multiple phone conferences with James Bopp, Jr. regarding new retainer agreement; draft the same; conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding revision	1.90 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/30/2022	JB E-mail exchange regarding AO Motion to Reconsider; phone conference regarding legal issues with Courtney Turner Milbank	0.80 450.00/hr	360.00
	JB Revise draft of the new retainer agreement; multiple phone conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding same and revisions	0.80 450.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM Conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding motion to reconsider	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
8/31/2022	MM Review Supplemental Order, make notes	0.50 150.00/hr	75.00
	MM Review Contempt Order, make notes	0.80 150.00/hr	120.00
	MM Review Writ Order, make notes	0.50 150.00/hr	75.00
	MM Draft Appellant Brief Fact Section	3.70 150.00/hr	555.00
	JM Conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding briefing needs for reply to AO's opposition to PHV admission	0.20 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JM Review and edit new retainer agreement	0.20 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JM Review various emails concerning new retainer agreement	0.30 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JM Review and notate AO objection to PHV admissions	1.30 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JM Draft reply in support of PHV motions; two conferences with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding same	3.00 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/31/2022	CEM Continue working on amended retainer and review rules of professional conduct; multiple conferences with James Bopp, Jr. and with Mike Dean regarding the same	2.00 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM Two conferences with Joseph Maughon regarding reply in support of motion for PHV	0.20 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM Review and annotate AO Opposition	0.30 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JB Revised new retainer agreement; phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank	0.60 450.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JB E-mail exchange regarding retainer agreement; review additional revision from Mike Dean; phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding revision; email Mike Dean regarding revision	0.60 450.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JB E-mail exchange regarding revision of retainer agreement; phone conference with Courtney Turner Milbank regarding additional revision; email Steve final	0.80 450.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM Conference with Joseph Maughon regarding briefing needs for reply to AO's opposition to PHV admission	0.20 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	For professional services rendered	302.90	\$73,514.00
	Additional charges:		
		<u>Qty/Price</u>	
8/15/2022	Travel expense for James Bopp, Jr. to attend Purge Hearing in Madison, WI from August 15--16, 2022	1 \$1,166.45	1,166.45

	<u>Qty/Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/17/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research standard of review for appeal of contempt finding and imposition of sanctions	37 \$3.00	111.00
Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research standard of review for appeal of contempt finding and imposition of sanctions	28 \$3.00	84.00
8/18/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research Wisconsin law on consolidation	24 \$3.00	72.00
8/24/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--Locate cases on whether, in any circumstance, judge must refer any aspect of recusal determination to different judge	11 \$3.00	33.00
Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research lawsuit ramifications of termination of head of governmental entity	77 \$3.00	231.00
8/26/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research effect of office subject to public records requests having no staff	28 \$3.00	84.00
Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research representation of entities with no staff or employees	41 \$3.00	123.00
Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research effect of dissolution of entity on legal representation of entity	41 \$3.00	123.00
Total costs		<u>\$2,027.45</u>
Total amount of this bill		\$75,541.45
Previous balance		\$74,755.91
9/1/2022 Payment - thank you. Check No. 1002554683		(\$74,755.91)

	<u>Amount</u>
Total payments and adjustments	(\$74,755.91)
Balance due	\$75,541.45

Attorney Summary				
<u>Name</u>	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
Cassandra Dougherty	3.20	175.00	\$560.00	
Cassandra Dougherty	1.70	0.00	\$0.00	
Courtney E. Milbank	53.10	240.00	\$12,744.00	
Courtney E. Milbank	10.50	0.00	\$0.00	
James Bopp, Jr.	51.30	450.00	\$23,085.00	
James Bopp, Jr.	3.70	0.00	\$0.00	
Jeffrey P. Gallant	13.20	420.00	\$5,544.00	
Jeffrey P. Gallant	0.40	0.00	\$0.00	
Joseph Maughon	95.90	240.00	\$23,016.00	
Joseph Maughon	6.90	0.00	\$0.00	
Michael Massie	57.10	150.00	\$8,565.00	
Michael Massie	5.90	0.00	\$0.00	